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APN: 359-201-10 TS No:
CA08000522-22-1 TO No:
220294657-CA-VOI NO-
TICE OF TRUSTEE'S
SALE (The above state-
ment is made pursuant to
CA Civil Code Section
2923.3(d)(1). The Sum-
mary will be provided to
Trustor(s) and/or vested
owner(s) only, pursuant to
CA Civil Code Section
2923.3(d)(2).) YOU ARE
IN DEFAULT UNDER A
DEED OF TRUST DATED
October 17, 2006. UN-
LESS YOU TAKE AC-
T I O N T O P R O T E C T
YOUR PROPERTY, IT
MAY BE SOLD AT A PUB-
LIC SALE. IF YOU NEED
AN EXPLANATION OF
THE NATURE OF THE
P R O C E E D I N G S
AGAINST YOU, YOU
SHOULD CONTACT A
LAWYER. On October 4,
2022 at 12:00 PM, At the
North front entrance to the
County Courthouse, 700
Civic Center Drive West,
Santa Ana, CA 92701,
MTC Financial Inc. dba
Trustee Corps, as the duly
Appointed Trustee, under
and pursuant to the power
of sale contained in that
certain Deed of Trust Re-
corded on October 24,
2006 as Instrument No.
2006000717547, of offi-
cial records in the Office of
the Recorder of Orange
County, California, ex-
ecuted by DEBRA J MA-
NIACI, AN UNMARRIED
WOMAN, AND LINDA L
DOYLE, AN UMARRIED
WOMAN; AS TENANTS
I N C O M M O N , E A C H
WITH A 50 PERCENT
UNDIVIDED INTEREST,
as Trustor(s), in favor of
MORTGAGE ELECTRON-
IC REGISTRATION SYS-
TEMS, INC, as Benefi-
c iary, as nominee for
COUNTRYWIDE HOME
LOANS, INC. as Benefi-
ciary, WILL SELL AT PUB-
LIC AUCTION TO THE
HIGHEST BIDDER, in law-
ful money of the United
States, all payable at the
time of sale, that certain
property situated in said
County, California describ-
ing the land therein as: AS
M O R E F U L L Y D E -
SCRIBED IN SAID DEED
OF TRUST The property
heretofore described is be-
ing sold “as is”. The street
address and other com-
mon designation, if any, of
the real proper ty de-
scribed above is purpor-
ted to be: 300 N LAKE-
DALE DR, ANAHEIM, CA
92807-2927 The under-
signed Trustee disclaims
any liability for any incor-
rectness of the street ad-
dress and other common
designation, if any, shown
herein. Said sale will be
made without covenant or
warranty, express or im-
plied, regarding title, pos-
session, or encumbrances,
to pay the remaining prin-
cipal sum of the Note(s)
secured by said Deed of
Trust, with interest there-
on, as provided in said
Note(s), advances if any,
under the terms of the
Deed of Trust, estimated
fees, charges and ex-
penses of the Trustee and
of the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust. The
total amount of the unpaid
balance of the obligations
secured by the property to
be sold and reasonable
es t ima ted cos ts , ex -
penses and advances at
the time of the initial pub-
lication of this Notice of
Trustee’s Sale is estim-
ated to be $527,452.11
(Estimated). However, pre-
payment premiums, ac-
crued interest and ad-
vances will increase this
figure prior to sale. Benefi-
ciary’s bid at said sale may
include all or part of said
amount. In addit ion to
cash, the Trustee will ac-
cept a cashier’s check
drawn on a state or nation-
al bank, a check drawn by
a state or federal credit
union or a check drawn by
a state or federal savings
and loan association, sav-
ings association or sav-
ings bank specified in Sec-
tion 5102 of the California
Financial Code and au-
thorized to do business in
California, or other such
funds as may be accept-
able to the Trustee. In the
event tender other than
cash is accepted, the
Trustee may withhold the
issuance of the Trustee’s
Deed Upon Sale unt i l
funds become available to
the payee or endorsee as
a matter of right. The prop-
erty offered for sale ex-
cludes all funds held on
account by the property re-
ceiver, if applicable. If the
Trustee is unable to con-
vey title for any reason,
the successful bidder’s
sole and exclusive rem-
edy shall be the return of
monies paid to the Trust-
ee and the successful bid-
der shall have no further
recourse. Notice to Poten-
tial Bidders If you are con-
sidering bidding on this
property lien, you should
understand that there are
risks involved in bidding at
a Trustee auction. You will
be bidding on a lien, not
on the property itself. Pla-
cing the highest bid at a
Trustee auction does not
automatically entitle you to
free and clear ownership
o f the proper ty . You
should also be aware that
the lien being auctioned off
may be a junior lien. If you
are the highest bidder at
the auction, you are or
may be responsible for
paying off all liens senior
to the lien being auctioned
off, before you can re-
ceive clear tit le to the
property. You are encour-
aged to investigate the ex-
istence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens that
may exist on this property
by contacting the county
recorder's office or a title
insurance company, either
of which may charge you a
fee for this information. If
you consult either of these
resources, you should be
aware that the same
Lender may hold more
than one mortgage or
Deed of Trust on the prop-
erty. Notice to Property
Owner The sale date
shown on this Notice of
Sale may be postponed
one or more times by the
Mortgagee, Beneficiary,
Trustee, or a court, pursu-
ant to Section 2924g of the
California Civil Code. The
law requires that informa-
tion about Trustee Sale
postponements be made
available to you and to the
public, as a courtesy to
those not present at the
sale. If you wish to learn
whether your sale date
has been postponed, and,
if applicable, the resched-
uled time and date for the
sale of this property, you
may call ServiceLink Auc-
tion | Hudson and Mar-
shall at (866) 539-4173 for
information regarding the
Trustee's Sale or visit the
Internet Website address
h t t p s : / / w w w . s e r -
vicelinkauction.com/ for in-
formation regarding the
sale of this property, using
the file number assigned
to this case, CA08000522-
22-1. Information about
postponements that are
very short in duration or
that occur close in time to
the scheduled sale may
not immediately be reflec-
ted in the telephone in-
formation or on the Inter-
net Website. The best way
to verify postponement in-
formation is to attend the
scheduled sale. Notice to
Tenant NOTICE TO TEN-
ANT FOR FORECLOS-
URES AFTER JANUARY
1, 2021 You may have a
right to purchase this prop-
erty after the trustee auc-
tion pursuant to Section
2924m of the California
Civil Code. If you are an
“eligible tenant buyer,” you
can purchase the property
if you match the last and
highest bid placed at the
trustee auction. If you are
an “eligible bidder,” you
may be able to purchase
the property if you exceed
the last and highest bid
placed at the trustee auc-
tion. There are three steps
to exercising this right of
purchase. First, 48 hours
after the date of the trust-
ee sale, you can call (866)
539-4173, or visit this in-
t e r n e t w e b s i t e
h t t p s : / / w w w . s e r -
vicelinkauction.com/, us-
ing the file number as-
s i g n e d t o t h i s c a s e
CA08000522-22-1 to find
the date on which the
trustee’s sale was held,
the amount of the last and
highest bid, and the ad-
dress of the t rus tee.
Second, you must send a
written notice of intent to
place a bid so that the
trustee receives it no more
than 15 days after the
trustee’s sale. Third, you
must submit a bid so that
the trustee receives it no
more than 45 days after
the trustee’s sale. If you
think you may qualify as
an “eligible tenant buyer”
or “eligible bidder,” you
should consider contact-
ing an attorney or appro-
priate real estate profes-
sional immediately for ad-
vice regarding this poten-
tial right to purchase. Date:
August 29, 2022 MTC Fin-
ancial Inc. dba Trustee
C o r p s T S N o .
CA08000522-22-1 17100
Gillette Ave Irvine, CA
92614 Phone: 949-252-
8300 TDD: 866-660-4288
By: Loan Quema, Author-
ized Signatory SALE IN-
FORMATION CAN BE
OBTAINED ONLINE AT
h t t p s : / / w w w . s e r -
vicelinkauction.com/ FOR
AUTOMATED SALES IN-
FORMATION PLEASE
CALL: ServiceLink Auc-
tion | Hudson and Mar-
shall at (866) 539-4173
NPP0415488 To: INDE-
PENDENT 09/07/2022,
09/14/2022, 09/21/2022
Anaheim  Independent
9/7,14,21/22-122688

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT

NO. 20226643089
OC GLAM LAB, Located
at: 13532 LORETTA DR,
TUSTIN, CA 92780-9278.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
trant(s): JENNIFER NEW-
COMER, 13532 LOR-
ETTA DR, TUSTIN, CA
92780. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: INDIVIDUAL. Re-
gistrant(s): /s/ JENNIFER
NEWCOMER. I declare
that all information in this
statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information
which he or she knows to
be false is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk
of Orange County on
08/30/2022.

Buena Park/Anaheim
Independent

9/7,14,21,28/22-122709
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of sale contained in that
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drawn on a state or nation-
al bank, a check drawn by
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the successful bidder’s
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edy shall be the return of
monies paid to the Trust-
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CHANGING 
YOUR NAME
AND NEED 

TO PUBLISH?
For all public 

notices, please 
call us for 
rates and 

information:

(714)
894-2575



T.S. No.: 2018-02225-
CA           
   
A.P.N.:939-78-047
Property Address: 1250 
South Brookhurst Street 
1104, Anaheim, CA 92804

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S 
SALE

PURSUANT TO CIVIL 
CODE § 2923.3(a) and (d), 
THE SUMMARY OF IN-
FORMATION REFERRED 
TO BELOW IS NOT AT-
TACHED TO THE RE-
CORDED COPY OF THIS 
DOCUMENT BUT ONLY 
TO THE COPIES PROVID-
ED TO THE TRUSTOR. 

NOTE: THERE IS A SUM-
MARY OF THE INFORMA-
TION IN THIS DOCUMENT 
ATTACHED 

注：本文件包含一个信息
摘要
참고사항: 본 첨부 문서에 
정보 요약서가 있습니다 
NOTA: SE ADJUNTA UN 
RESUMEN DE LA INFOR-
MACIÓN DE ESTE DOCU-
MENTO
TALA: MAYROONG BUOD 
NG IMPORMASYON SA 
DOKUMENTONG ITO NA 
NAKALAKIP 
LƯU Ý: KÈM THEO ĐÂY 
LÀ BẢN TRÌNH BÀY TÓM 
LƯỢC VỀ THÔNG TIN 
TRONG TÀI LIỆU NÀY

IMPORTANT NOTICE TO 
PROPERTY OWNER: 
YOU ARE IN DEFAULT UN-
DER A DEED OF TRUST 
DATED 06/24/2005. UN-
LESS YOU TAKE ACTION 
TO PROTECT YOUR 
PROPERTY, IT MAY BE 
SOLD AT A PUBLIC SALE. 
IF YOU NEED AN EXPLA-
NATION OF THE NATURE 
OF THE PROCEEDING 
AGAINST YOU, YOU 
SHOULD CONTACT A 
LAWYER.

Trustor: Porfirio Ibarra, A 
Married Man as His Sole 
And Separate Property
Duly Appointed Trustee: 
Western Progressive, LLC
Deed of Trust Recorded 
07/08/2005 as Instrument 
No. 2005000526179 in book 
---, page--- and of Official 
Records in the office of the 
Recorder of Orange County, 
California, 
Date of Sale: 10/24/2022 at 
03:00 PM
Place of Sale: O N 
THE FRONT STEPS TO 
THE ENTRANCE OF THE 
ORANGE CIVIC CENTER, 
300 E. CHAPMAN AVE-
NUE, ORANGE, CA 92866

Estimated amount of un-
paid balance, reasonably 
estimated costs and other 
charges: $ 511,641.57

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S 
SALE

THE TRUSTEE WILL SELL 
AT PUBLIC AUCTION 
TO HIGHEST BIDDER 
FOR CASH, CASHIER’S 
CHECK DRAWN ON A 
STATE OR NATIONAL 
BANK, A CHECK DRAWN 
BY A STATE OR FEDER-
AL CREDIT UNION, OR 
A CHECK DRAWN BY A 
STATE OR FEDERAL SAV-
INGS AND LOAN ASSO-
CIATION, A SAVINGS AS-
SOCIATION OR SAVINGS 
BANK SPECIFIED IN SEC-
TION 5102 OF THE FINAN-
CIAL CODE AND AUTHO-
RIZED TO DO BUSINESS 
IN THIS STATE:

All right, title, and interest 
conveyed to and now held 
by the trustee in the herein-
after described property un-
der and pursuant to a Deed 
of Trust described as:

More fully described in said 
Deed of Trust.

Street Address or other 
common designation of 
real property: 1250 South 
Brookhurst Street 1104, 
Anaheim, CA 92804 
A.P.N.: 939-78-047

The undersigned Trustee 
disclaims any liability for any 
incorrectness of the street 
address or other common 
designation, if any, shown 
above.

The sale will be made, but 
without covenant or war-
ranty, expressed or implied, 
regarding title, possession, 
or encumbrances, to pay the 
remaining principal sum of 
the note(s) secured by the 
Deed of Trust with interest 
thereon, as provided in said 
note(s), advances, under the 
terms of said Deed of Trust, 
fees, charges and expenses 
of the Trustee and of the 
trusts created by said Deed 
of Trust. The total amount 
of the unpaid balance of the 
obligation secured by the 
property to be sold and rea-
sonable estimated costs, ex-
penses and advances at the 
time of the initial publication 
of the Notice of Sale is: 
$ 511,641.57.

Note: Because the Ben-
eficiary reserves the right 
to bid less than the total 
debt owed, it is possible 
that at the time of the sale 
the opening bid may be less 
than the total debt.

If the Trustee is unable to 
convey title for any reason, 
the successful bidder’s sole 
and exclusive remedy shall 
be the return of monies paid 
to the Trustee, and the suc-
cessful bidder shall have no 
further recourse.

The beneficiary of the Deed 
of Trust has executed and 

delivered to the undersigned 
a written request to com-
mence foreclosure, and the 
undersigned caused a No-
tice of Default and Election 
to Sell to be recorded in the 
county where the real prop-
erty is located. 
 

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S 
SALE

NOTICE TO POTENTIAL 
BIDDERS:  If you are con-
sidering bidding on this 
property lien, you should 
understand that there are 
risks involved in bidding at 
a trustee auction. You will be 
bidding on a lien, not on the 
property itself.  Placing the 
highest bid at a trustee auc-
tion does not automatically 
entitle you to free and clear 
ownership of the property. 
You should also be aware 
that the lien being auctioned 
off may be a junior lien. If 
you are the highest bid-
der at the auction, you are 
or may be responsible for 
paying off all liens senior to 
the lien being auctioned off, 
before you can receive clear 
title to the property. You are 
encouraged to investigate 
the existence, priority, and 
size of outstanding liens 
that may exist on this prop-
erty by contacting the county 
recorder’s office or a title 
insurance company, either 
of which may charge you 
a fee for this information. If 
you consult either of these 
resources, you should be 
aware that the same lender 
may hold more than one 
mortgage or deed of trust on 
this property.

NOTICE TO PROPERTY 
OWNER:  The sale date 
shown on this notice of 
sale may be postponed 
one or more times by the 
mortgagee, beneficiary, 
trustee, or a court, pursu-
ant to Section 2924g of the 
California Civil Code. The 
law requires that information 
about trustee sale postpone-
ments be made available to 
you and to the public, as a 
courtesy to those not pres-
ent at the sale. If you wish 
to learn whether your sale 
date has been postponed, 
and, if applicable, the re-
scheduled time and date for 
the sale of this property, you 
may call (866)-960-8299 or 
visit this Internet Web site 
https://www.altisource.com/
loginpage.aspx using the 
file number assigned to this 
case 2018-02225-CA. In-
formation about postpone-
ments that are very short in 
duration or that occur close 
in time to the scheduled 
sale may not immediately 
be reflected in the telephone 
information or on the In-
ternet Web site.  The best 
way to verify postponement 
information is to attend the 

scheduled sale.

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S 
SALE

 
NOTICE TO TENANT: You 
may have a right to pur-
chase this property after the 
trustee auction, if conducted 
after January 1, 2021, pur-
suant to Section 2924m of 
the California Civil Code. If 
you are an “eligible tenant 
buyer,” you can purchase 
the property if you match the 
last and highest bid placed 
at the trustee auction. If you 
are an “eligible bidder,” you 
may be able to purchase the 
property if you exceed the 
last and highest bid placed 
at the trustee auction. There 
are three steps to exercising 
this right of purchase. First, 
48 hours after the date of 
the trustee sale, you can call 
(866)-960-8299, or visit this 
internet website https://www.
altisource.com/loginpage.
aspx, using the file number 
assigned to this case 2018-
02225-CA  to find the date 
on which the trustee’s sale 
was held, the amount of the 
last and highest bid, and the 
address of the trustee. Sec-
ond, you must send a written 
notice of intent to place a bid 
so that the trustee receives 
it no more than 15 days af-
ter the trustee’s sale. Third, 
you must submit a bid, by 
remitting the funds and af-
fidavit described in Section 
2924m(c) of the Civil Code, 
so that the trustee receives 
it no more than 45 days af-
ter the trustee’s sale. If you 
think you may qualify as an 
“eligible tenant buyer” or 
“eligible bidder,” you should 
consider contacting an attor-
ney or appropriate real es-
tate professional immediate-
ly for advice regarding this 
potential right to purchase.

Date: August 23, 2022 
Western Progressive, LLC, 
as Trustee for beneficiary
C/o 1500 Palma Drive, Suite 
238
Ventura, CA 93003
Sale Information Line: (866) 
960-8299 https://www.alti-
source.com/loginpage.aspx

         __________________
______________________
________
            Trustee Sale Assistant

WESTERN PROGRES-
SIVE, LLC MAY BE ACT-
ING AS A DEBT COLLEC-
TOR ATTEMPTING TO 
COLLECT A DEBT. ANY 
INFORMATION OBTAINED 
MAY BE USED FOR THAT 
PURPOSE.

Independent 9/7,14,21,/2022-
122593

Legals-IND

T.S. No.: 9462-5167 TSG
Order No.: 210666497-
CA-VOO A.P.N.: 128-141-
1 6 N O T I C E O F
TRUSTEE'S SALE YOU
ARE IN DEFAULT UN-
DER A DEED OF TRUST
DATED 06/16/2006. UN-
LESS YOU TAKE AC-
T I O N T O P R O T E C T
YOUR PROPERTY, IT
MAY BE SOLD AT A PUB-
LIC SALE. IF YOU NEED
AN EXPLANATION OF
THE NATURE OF THE
PROCEEDING AGAINST
Y O U , Y O U S H O U L D
CONTACT A LAWYER.
NBS Default Services,
LLC, as the duly appoin-
ted Trustee, under and
pursuant to the power of
sale contained in that cer-
tain Deed of Trust Recor-
ded 06/21/2006 as Docu-
m e n t N o . :
2006000416509, of Offi-
cial Records in the office
of the Recorder of Orange
County, California, ex-
ecuted by: MARTHA E
GODOY, A MARRIED
WOMAN AS HER SOLE
AND SEPARATE PROP-
ERTY, as Trustor, WILL
SELL AT PUBLIC AUC-
TION TO THE HIGHEST
BIDDER FOR CASH (pay-
able in full at time of sale
by cash, a cashier's check
drawn by a state or nation-
al bank, a check drawn by
a state or federal credit
union, or a check drawn by
a state or federal savings
and loan association, sav-
ings association, or sav-
ings bank specified in sec-
tion 5102 of the Financial
Code and authorized to do
business in this state). All
right, title and interest con-
veyed to and now held by
it under said Deed of Trust
in the property situated in
said County and state, and
as more fully described in
the above referenced
Deed of Trust. Sale Date &
Time: 10/17/2022 at 9:00
AM Sale Location: Auc-
tion.com Room Double-
tree by Hilton Hotel Ana-
heim - Orange County,
100 The City Drive, Or-
ange, CA 92868 The
street address and other
common designation, if
any, of the real property
described above is purpor-
ted to be: 1916 W ELM
PLACE, ANAHEIM, CA
92804-2554 The under-
signed Trustee disclaims
any liability for any incor-
rectness of the street ad-
dress and other common
designation, if any, shown
herein. Said sale will be
made in an “AS IS” condi-
tion, but without covenant
or warranty, expressed or
implied, regarding title,
possession, or encum-
brances, to pay the re-
maining principal sum of
the note(s) secured by
said Deed of Trust, with in-
terest thereon, as provided
in said note(s), advances,
if any, under the terms of
the Deed of Trust, estim-
ated fees, charges and ex-
penses of the Trustee and
of the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust, to-wit:
$580,311.46 (Estimated).
Accrued interest and addi-
tional advances, if any, will
increase this figure prior to
sale. It is possible that at
the time of sale the open-
ing bid may be less than
the total indebtedness
due. NOTICE TO POTEN-
TIAL BIDDERS: If you are
considering bidding on this
property lien, you should
understand that there are
risks involved in bidding at
a trustee auction. You will
be bidding on a lien, not
on the property itself. Pla-
cing the highest bid at a
trustee auction does not
automatically entitle you to
free and clear ownership
o f the proper ty . You
should also be aware that
the lien being auctioned off
may be a junior lien. If you
are the highest bidder at
the auction, you are or
may be responsible for
paying off all liens senior
to the lien being auctioned
off, before you can re-
ceive clear tit le to the
property. You are encour-
aged to investigate the ex-
istence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens that
may exist on this property
by contacting the county
recorder’s office or a title
insurance company, either
of which may charge you a
fee for this information. If
you consult either of these
resources, you should be
aware that the same
lender may hold more than
one mortgage or deed of
trust on the property. NO-
TICE TO PROPERTY
OWNER: The sale date
shown on this notice of
sale may be postponed
one or more times by the
mortgagee, beneficiary,
trustee, or a court, pursu-
ant to Section 2924g of the
California Civil Code. The
law requires that informa-
tion about trustee sale
postponements be made
available to you and to the
public, as a courtesy to
those not present at the
sale. If you wish to learn
whether your sale date
has been postponed, and,
if applicable, the resched-
uled time and date for the
sale of this property, you
may call 1-800-280-2832
or visit this internet web-
site, www.auction.com, us-
ing the file number as-
signed to this case T.S.#
9462-5167. Information
about postponements that
are very short in duration
or that occur close in time
to the scheduled sale may
not immediately be reflec-
ted in the telephone in-
formation or on the inter-
net website. The best way
to verify postponement in-
formation is to attend the
scheduled sale. NOTICE
TO TENANT: You may
have a right to purchase
this property after the
trustee auction pursuant to
Section 2924m of the Cali-
fornia Civil Code. If you
are an “eligible tenant buy-
er,” you can purchase the
property if you match the
last and highest bid placed
at the trustee auction. If
you a re an “e l i g i b l e
bidder,” you may be able
to purchase the property if
you exceed the last and
highest bid placed at the
trustee auction. There are
three steps to exercising
this right of purchase.
First, 48 hours after the
date of the trustee sale,
you can call 855-976-
3916, or visit this internet
website https://tracker.auc-
tion.com/sb1079/, using
the file number assigned
to this case T.S.# 9462-
5167 to find the date on
which the trustee’s sale
was held, the amount of
the last and highest bid,
and the address of the
trustee. Second, you must
send a written notice of in-
tent to place a bid so that
the trustee receives it no
more than 15 days after
the trustee’s sale. Third,
you must submit a bid so
that the trustee receives it
no more than 45 days after
the trustee’s sale. If you
think you may qualify as
an “eligible tenant buyer”
or “eligible bidder,” you
should consider contact-
ing an attorney or appro-
priate real estate profes-
sional immediately for ad-
vice regarding this poten-
tial right to purchase. If the
Trustee is unable to con-
vey title for any reason,
the successful bidder’s
sole and exclusive rem-
edy shall be the return of
monies paid to the Trust-
ee and the successful bid-
der shall have no further
recourse. NBS Default
Services, LLC 14841 Dal-
las Parkway, Suite 425
Dallas, TX 75254 800-766-
7751 For Trustee Sale In-
format ion Log On To:
www.auction.com or Call:
1-800-280-2832. NBS De-
fault Services, LLC, James
Aranda, Foreclosure Asso-
ciate This communication
is an attempt to collect a
debt and any information
obtained will be used for
that purpose. However, if
you have received a dis-
charge of the debt refer-
enced herein in a bank-
ruptcy proceeding, this is
not an attempt to impose
personal liability upon you
for payment of that debt. In
the event you have re-
ceived a bankruptcy dis-
charge, any action to en-
force the debt will be taken
against the property only.
NPP0415824 To: INDE-
PENDENT 09/21/2022,
09/28/2022, 10/05/2022
Anaheim  Independent
9/21,28,10/5/22-123039

Legals-IND

T.S. No.: 9462-5167 TSG
Order No.: 210666497-
CA-VOO A.P.N.: 128-141-
1 6 N O T I C E O F
TRUSTEE'S SALE YOU
ARE IN DEFAULT UN-
DER A DEED OF TRUST
DATED 06/16/2006. UN-
LESS YOU TAKE AC-
T I O N T O P R O T E C T
YOUR PROPERTY, IT
MAY BE SOLD AT A PUB-
LIC SALE. IF YOU NEED
AN EXPLANATION OF
THE NATURE OF THE
PROCEEDING AGAINST
Y O U , Y O U S H O U L D
CONTACT A LAWYER.
NBS Default Services,
LLC, as the duly appoin-
ted Trustee, under and
pursuant to the power of
sale contained in that cer-
tain Deed of Trust Recor-
ded 06/21/2006 as Docu-
m e n t N o . :
2006000416509, of Offi-
cial Records in the office
of the Recorder of Orange
County, California, ex-
ecuted by: MARTHA E
GODOY, A MARRIED
WOMAN AS HER SOLE
AND SEPARATE PROP-
ERTY, as Trustor, WILL
SELL AT PUBLIC AUC-
TION TO THE HIGHEST
BIDDER FOR CASH (pay-
able in full at time of sale
by cash, a cashier's check
drawn by a state or nation-
al bank, a check drawn by
a state or federal credit
union, or a check drawn by
a state or federal savings
and loan association, sav-
ings association, or sav-
ings bank specified in sec-
tion 5102 of the Financial
Code and authorized to do
business in this state). All
right, title and interest con-
veyed to and now held by
it under said Deed of Trust
in the property situated in
said County and state, and
as more fully described in
the above referenced
Deed of Trust. Sale Date &
Time: 10/17/2022 at 9:00
AM Sale Location: Auc-
tion.com Room Double-
tree by Hilton Hotel Ana-
heim - Orange County,
100 The City Drive, Or-
ange, CA 92868 The
street address and other
common designation, if
any, of the real property
described above is purpor-
ted to be: 1916 W ELM
PLACE, ANAHEIM, CA
92804-2554 The under-
signed Trustee disclaims
any liability for any incor-
rectness of the street ad-
dress and other common
designation, if any, shown
herein. Said sale will be
made in an “AS IS” condi-
tion, but without covenant
or warranty, expressed or
implied, regarding title,
possession, or encum-
brances, to pay the re-
maining principal sum of
the note(s) secured by
said Deed of Trust, with in-
terest thereon, as provided
in said note(s), advances,
if any, under the terms of
the Deed of Trust, estim-
ated fees, charges and ex-
penses of the Trustee and
of the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust, to-wit:
$580,311.46 (Estimated).
Accrued interest and addi-
tional advances, if any, will
increase this figure prior to
sale. It is possible that at
the time of sale the open-
ing bid may be less than
the total indebtedness
due. NOTICE TO POTEN-
TIAL BIDDERS: If you are
considering bidding on this
property lien, you should
understand that there are
risks involved in bidding at
a trustee auction. You will
be bidding on a lien, not
on the property itself. Pla-
cing the highest bid at a
trustee auction does not
automatically entitle you to
free and clear ownership
o f the proper ty . You
should also be aware that
the lien being auctioned off
may be a junior lien. If you
are the highest bidder at
the auction, you are or
may be responsible for
paying off all liens senior
to the lien being auctioned
off, before you can re-
ceive clear tit le to the
property. You are encour-
aged to investigate the ex-
istence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens that
may exist on this property
by contacting the county
recorder’s office or a title
insurance company, either
of which may charge you a
fee for this information. If
you consult either of these
resources, you should be
aware that the same
lender may hold more than
one mortgage or deed of
trust on the property. NO-
TICE TO PROPERTY
OWNER: The sale date
shown on this notice of
sale may be postponed
one or more times by the
mortgagee, beneficiary,
trustee, or a court, pursu-
ant to Section 2924g of the
California Civil Code. The
law requires that informa-
tion about trustee sale
postponements be made
available to you and to the
public, as a courtesy to
those not present at the
sale. If you wish to learn
whether your sale date
has been postponed, and,
if applicable, the resched-
uled time and date for the
sale of this property, you
may call 1-800-280-2832
or visit this internet web-
site, www.auction.com, us-
ing the file number as-
signed to this case T.S.#
9462-5167. Information
about postponements that
are very short in duration
or that occur close in time
to the scheduled sale may
not immediately be reflec-
ted in the telephone in-
formation or on the inter-
net website. The best way
to verify postponement in-
formation is to attend the
scheduled sale. NOTICE
TO TENANT: You may
have a right to purchase
this property after the
trustee auction pursuant to
Section 2924m of the Cali-
fornia Civil Code. If you
are an “eligible tenant buy-
er,” you can purchase the
property if you match the
last and highest bid placed
at the trustee auction. If
you a re an “e l i g i b le
bidder,” you may be able
to purchase the property if
you exceed the last and
highest bid placed at the
trustee auction. There are
three steps to exercising
this right of purchase.
First, 48 hours after the
date of the trustee sale,
you can call 855-976-
3916, or visit this internet
website https://tracker.auc-
tion.com/sb1079/, using
the file number assigned
to this case T.S.# 9462-
5167 to find the date on
which the trustee’s sale
was held, the amount of
the last and highest bid,
and the address of the
trustee. Second, you must
send a written notice of in-
tent to place a bid so that
the trustee receives it no
more than 15 days after
the trustee’s sale. Third,
you must submit a bid so
that the trustee receives it
no more than 45 days after
the trustee’s sale. If you
think you may qualify as
an “eligible tenant buyer”
or “eligible bidder,” you
should consider contact-
ing an attorney or appro-
priate real estate profes-
sional immediately for ad-
vice regarding this poten-
tial right to purchase. If the
Trustee is unable to con-
vey title for any reason,
the successful bidder’s
sole and exclusive rem-
edy shall be the return of
monies paid to the Trust-
ee and the successful bid-
der shall have no further
recourse. NBS Default
Services, LLC 14841 Dal-
las Parkway, Suite 425
Dallas, TX 75254 800-766-
7751 For Trustee Sale In-
format ion Log On To:
www.auction.com or Call:
1-800-280-2832. NBS De-
fault Services, LLC, James
Aranda, Foreclosure Asso-
ciate This communication
is an attempt to collect a
debt and any information
obtained will be used for
that purpose. However, if
you have received a dis-
charge of the debt refer-
enced herein in a bank-
ruptcy proceeding, this is
not an attempt to impose
personal liability upon you
for payment of that debt. In
the event you have re-
ceived a bankruptcy dis-
charge, any action to en-
force the debt will be taken
against the property only.
NPP0415824 To: INDE-
PENDENT 09/21/2022,
09/28/2022, 10/05/2022
Anaheim  Independent
9/21,28,10/5/22-123039

Legals-IND

T.S. No.: 9462-5167 TSG
Order No.: 210666497-
CA-VOO A.P.N.: 128-141-
1 6 N O T I C E O F
TRUSTEE'S SALE YOU
ARE IN DEFAULT UN-
DER A DEED OF TRUST
DATED 06/16/2006. UN-
LESS YOU TAKE AC-
T I O N T O P R O T E C T
YOUR PROPERTY, IT
MAY BE SOLD AT A PUB-
LIC SALE. IF YOU NEED
AN EXPLANATION OF
THE NATURE OF THE
PROCEEDING AGAINST
Y O U , Y O U S H O U L D
CONTACT A LAWYER.
NBS Default Services,
LLC, as the duly appoin-
ted Trustee, under and
pursuant to the power of
sale contained in that cer-
tain Deed of Trust Recor-
ded 06/21/2006 as Docu-
m e n t N o . :
2006000416509, of Offi-
cial Records in the office
of the Recorder of Orange
County, California, ex-
ecuted by: MARTHA E
GODOY, A MARRIED
WOMAN AS HER SOLE
AND SEPARATE PROP-
ERTY, as Trustor, WILL
SELL AT PUBLIC AUC-
TION TO THE HIGHEST
BIDDER FOR CASH (pay-
able in full at time of sale
by cash, a cashier's check
drawn by a state or nation-
al bank, a check drawn by
a state or federal credit
union, or a check drawn by
a state or federal savings
and loan association, sav-
ings association, or sav-
ings bank specified in sec-
tion 5102 of the Financial
Code and authorized to do
business in this state). All
right, title and interest con-
veyed to and now held by
it under said Deed of Trust
in the property situated in
said County and state, and
as more fully described in
the above referenced
Deed of Trust. Sale Date &
Time: 10/17/2022 at 9:00
AM Sale Location: Auc-
tion.com Room Double-
tree by Hilton Hotel Ana-
heim - Orange County,
100 The City Drive, Or-
ange, CA 92868 The
street address and other
common designation, if
any, of the real property
described above is purpor-
ted to be: 1916 W ELM
PLACE, ANAHEIM, CA
92804-2554 The under-
signed Trustee disclaims
any liability for any incor-
rectness of the street ad-
dress and other common
designation, if any, shown
herein. Said sale will be
made in an “AS IS” condi-
tion, but without covenant
or warranty, expressed or
implied, regarding title,
possession, or encum-
brances, to pay the re-
maining principal sum of
the note(s) secured by
said Deed of Trust, with in-
terest thereon, as provided
in said note(s), advances,
if any, under the terms of
the Deed of Trust, estim-
ated fees, charges and ex-
penses of the Trustee and
of the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust, to-wit:
$580,311.46 (Estimated).
Accrued interest and addi-
tional advances, if any, will
increase this figure prior to
sale. It is possible that at
the time of sale the open-
ing bid may be less than
the total indebtedness
due. NOTICE TO POTEN-
TIAL BIDDERS: If you are
considering bidding on this
property lien, you should
understand that there are
risks involved in bidding at
a trustee auction. You will
be bidding on a lien, not
on the property itself. Pla-
cing the highest bid at a
trustee auction does not
automatically entitle you to
free and clear ownership
o f the proper ty . You
should also be aware that
the lien being auctioned off
may be a junior lien. If you
are the highest bidder at
the auction, you are or
may be responsible for
paying off all liens senior
to the lien being auctioned
off, before you can re-
ceive clear tit le to the
property. You are encour-
aged to investigate the ex-
istence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens that
may exist on this property
by contacting the county
recorder’s office or a title
insurance company, either
of which may charge you a
fee for this information. If
you consult either of these
resources, you should be
aware that the same
lender may hold more than
one mortgage or deed of
trust on the property. NO-
TICE TO PROPERTY
OWNER: The sale date
shown on this notice of
sale may be postponed
one or more times by the
mortgagee, beneficiary,
trustee, or a court, pursu-
ant to Section 2924g of the
California Civil Code. The
law requires that informa-
tion about trustee sale
postponements be made
available to you and to the
public, as a courtesy to
those not present at the
sale. If you wish to learn
whether your sale date
has been postponed, and,
if applicable, the resched-
uled time and date for the
sale of this property, you
may call 1-800-280-2832
or visit this internet web-
site, www.auction.com, us-
ing the file number as-
signed to this case T.S.#
9462-5167. Information
about postponements that
are very short in duration
or that occur close in time
to the scheduled sale may
not immediately be reflec-
ted in the telephone in-
formation or on the inter-
net website. The best way
to verify postponement in-
formation is to attend the
scheduled sale. NOTICE
TO TENANT: You may
have a right to purchase
this property after the
trustee auction pursuant to
Section 2924m of the Cali-
fornia Civil Code. If you
are an “eligible tenant buy-
er,” you can purchase the
property if you match the
last and highest bid placed
at the trustee auction. If
you a re an “e l i g i b l e
bidder,” you may be able
to purchase the property if
you exceed the last and
highest bid placed at the
trustee auction. There are
three steps to exercising
this right of purchase.
First, 48 hours after the
date of the trustee sale,
you can call 855-976-
3916, or visit this internet
website https://tracker.auc-
tion.com/sb1079/, using
the file number assigned
to this case T.S.# 9462-
5167 to find the date on
which the trustee’s sale
was held, the amount of
the last and highest bid,
and the address of the
trustee. Second, you must
send a written notice of in-
tent to place a bid so that
the trustee receives it no
more than 15 days after
the trustee’s sale. Third,
you must submit a bid so
that the trustee receives it
no more than 45 days after
the trustee’s sale. If you
think you may qualify as
an “eligible tenant buyer”
or “eligible bidder,” you
should consider contact-
ing an attorney or appro-
priate real estate profes-
sional immediately for ad-
vice regarding this poten-
tial right to purchase. If the
Trustee is unable to con-
vey title for any reason,
the successful bidder’s
sole and exclusive rem-
edy shall be the return of
monies paid to the Trust-
ee and the successful bid-
der shall have no further
recourse. NBS Default
Services, LLC 14841 Dal-
las Parkway, Suite 425
Dallas, TX 75254 800-766-
7751 For Trustee Sale In-
format ion Log On To:
www.auction.com or Call:
1-800-280-2832. NBS De-
fault Services, LLC, James
Aranda, Foreclosure Asso-
ciate This communication
is an attempt to collect a
debt and any information
obtained will be used for
that purpose. However, if
you have received a dis-
charge of the debt refer-
enced herein in a bank-
ruptcy proceeding, this is
not an attempt to impose
personal liability upon you
for payment of that debt. In
the event you have re-
ceived a bankruptcy dis-
charge, any action to en-
force the debt will be taken
against the property only.
NPP0415824 To: INDE-
PENDENT 09/21/2022,
09/28/2022, 10/05/2022
Anaheim  Independent
9/21,28,10/5/22-123039

Legals-IND

T.S. No.: 9462-5167 TSG
Order No.: 210666497-
CA-VOO A.P.N.: 128-141-
1 6 N O T I C E O F
TRUSTEE'S SALE YOU
ARE IN DEFAULT UN-
DER A DEED OF TRUST
DATED 06/16/2006. UN-
LESS YOU TAKE AC-
T I O N T O P R O T E C T
YOUR PROPERTY, IT
MAY BE SOLD AT A PUB-
LIC SALE. IF YOU NEED
AN EXPLANATION OF
THE NATURE OF THE
PROCEEDING AGAINST
Y O U , Y O U S H O U L D
CONTACT A LAWYER.
NBS Default Services,
LLC, as the duly appoin-
ted Trustee, under and
pursuant to the power of
sale contained in that cer-
tain Deed of Trust Recor-
ded 06/21/2006 as Docu-
m e n t N o . :
2006000416509, of Offi-
cial Records in the office
of the Recorder of Orange
County, California, ex-
ecuted by: MARTHA E
GODOY, A MARRIED
WOMAN AS HER SOLE
AND SEPARATE PROP-
ERTY, as Trustor, WILL
SELL AT PUBLIC AUC-
TION TO THE HIGHEST
BIDDER FOR CASH (pay-
able in full at time of sale
by cash, a cashier's check
drawn by a state or nation-
al bank, a check drawn by
a state or federal credit
union, or a check drawn by
a state or federal savings
and loan association, sav-
ings association, or sav-
ings bank specified in sec-
tion 5102 of the Financial
Code and authorized to do
business in this state). All
right, title and interest con-
veyed to and now held by
it under said Deed of Trust
in the property situated in
said County and state, and
as more fully described in
the above referenced
Deed of Trust. Sale Date &
Time: 10/17/2022 at 9:00
AM Sale Location: Auc-
tion.com Room Double-
tree by Hilton Hotel Ana-
heim - Orange County,
100 The City Drive, Or-
ange, CA 92868 The
street address and other
common designation, if
any, of the real property
described above is purpor-
ted to be: 1916 W ELM
PLACE, ANAHEIM, CA
92804-2554 The under-
signed Trustee disclaims
any liability for any incor-
rectness of the street ad-
dress and other common
designation, if any, shown
herein. Said sale will be
made in an “AS IS” condi-
tion, but without covenant
or warranty, expressed or
implied, regarding title,
possession, or encum-
brances, to pay the re-
maining principal sum of
the note(s) secured by
said Deed of Trust, with in-
terest thereon, as provided
in said note(s), advances,
if any, under the terms of
the Deed of Trust, estim-
ated fees, charges and ex-
penses of the Trustee and
of the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust, to-wit:
$580,311.46 (Estimated).
Accrued interest and addi-
tional advances, if any, will
increase this figure prior to
sale. It is possible that at
the time of sale the open-
ing bid may be less than
the total indebtedness
due. NOTICE TO POTEN-
TIAL BIDDERS: If you are
considering bidding on this
property lien, you should
understand that there are
risks involved in bidding at
a trustee auction. You will
be bidding on a lien, not
on the property itself. Pla-
cing the highest bid at a
trustee auction does not
automatically entitle you to
free and clear ownership
o f the proper ty . You
should also be aware that
the lien being auctioned off
may be a junior lien. If you
are the highest bidder at
the auction, you are or
may be responsible for
paying off all liens senior
to the lien being auctioned
off, before you can re-
ceive clear tit le to the
property. You are encour-
aged to investigate the ex-
istence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens that
may exist on this property
by contacting the county
recorder’s office or a title
insurance company, either
of which may charge you a
fee for this information. If
you consult either of these
resources, you should be
aware that the same
lender may hold more than
one mortgage or deed of
trust on the property. NO-
TICE TO PROPERTY
OWNER: The sale date
shown on this notice of
sale may be postponed
one or more times by the
mortgagee, beneficiary,
trustee, or a court, pursu-
ant to Section 2924g of the
California Civil Code. The
law requires that informa-
tion about trustee sale
postponements be made
available to you and to the
public, as a courtesy to
those not present at the
sale. If you wish to learn
whether your sale date
has been postponed, and,
if applicable, the resched-
uled time and date for the
sale of this property, you
may call 1-800-280-2832
or visit this internet web-
site, www.auction.com, us-
ing the file number as-
signed to this case T.S.#
9462-5167. Information
about postponements that
are very short in duration
or that occur close in time
to the scheduled sale may
not immediately be reflec-
ted in the telephone in-
formation or on the inter-
net website. The best way
to verify postponement in-
formation is to attend the
scheduled sale. NOTICE
TO TENANT: You may
have a right to purchase
this property after the
trustee auction pursuant to
Section 2924m of the Cali-
fornia Civil Code. If you
are an “eligible tenant buy-
er,” you can purchase the
property if you match the
last and highest bid placed
at the trustee auction. If
you a re an “e l i g i b l e
bidder,” you may be able
to purchase the property if
you exceed the last and
highest bid placed at the
trustee auction. There are
three steps to exercising
this right of purchase.
First, 48 hours after the
date of the trustee sale,
you can call 855-976-
3916, or visit this internet
website https://tracker.auc-
tion.com/sb1079/, using
the file number assigned
to this case T.S.# 9462-
5167 to find the date on
which the trustee’s sale
was held, the amount of
the last and highest bid,
and the address of the
trustee. Second, you must
send a written notice of in-
tent to place a bid so that
the trustee receives it no
more than 15 days after
the trustee’s sale. Third,
you must submit a bid so
that the trustee receives it
no more than 45 days after
the trustee’s sale. If you
think you may qualify as
an “eligible tenant buyer”
or “eligible bidder,” you
should consider contact-
ing an attorney or appro-
priate real estate profes-
sional immediately for ad-
vice regarding this poten-
tial right to purchase. If the
Trustee is unable to con-
vey title for any reason,
the successful bidder’s
sole and exclusive rem-
edy shall be the return of
monies paid to the Trust-
ee and the successful bid-
der shall have no further
recourse. NBS Default
Services, LLC 14841 Dal-
las Parkway, Suite 425
Dallas, TX 75254 800-766-
7751 For Trustee Sale In-
format ion Log On To:
www.auction.com or Call:
1-800-280-2832. NBS De-
fault Services, LLC, James
Aranda, Foreclosure Asso-
ciate This communication
is an attempt to collect a
debt and any information
obtained will be used for
that purpose. However, if
you have received a dis-
charge of the debt refer-
enced herein in a bank-
ruptcy proceeding, this is
not an attempt to impose
personal liability upon you
for payment of that debt. In
the event you have re-
ceived a bankruptcy dis-
charge, any action to en-
force the debt will be taken
against the property only.
NPP0415824 To: INDE-
PENDENT 09/21/2022,
09/28/2022, 10/05/2022
Anaheim  Independent
9/21,28,10/5/22-123039
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ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
30-2022-01278427

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Pet i t ioner:
GABRIEL ALEXANDER
BLINKENBERG filed a pe-
tition with this court for a
decree changing names
as follows: GABRIEL AL-
EXANDER BLINKEN-
BERG to GABRIEL ALEX-
ANDER BLUHM. THE
COURT ORDERS that all
persons interested in this
matter shall appear before
this court at the hearing in-
dicated below to show
cause, if any, why the peti-
tion for change of name
should not be granted. Any
person objecting to the
name changes described
above must file a written
objection that includes the
reasons for the objection
at least two court days be-
fore the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and must
appear at the hearing to
show cause why the peti-
tion should not be granted.
If no written objection is
timely filed, the court may
grant the petition without a
hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING
11/15/2022, 8:30 a.m.

D100 REMOTE
Central Justice Center
700 Civic Center Drive

West
Santa Ana, CA 92701

A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be pub-
lished at least once each
week for four successive
weeks prior to the date set
for hearing on the petition
in the following newspa-
per of general circulation,
printed in this county:
Independent
Date: 9/02/2022
Judge Walter P Schwarm
Judge of the Superior
Court

Anaheim Independent
9/21,28,10/5,12/22-

122995

T.S. No.: 9462-5167 TSG
Order No.: 210666497-
CA-VOO A.P.N.: 128-141-
1 6 N O T I C E O F
TRUSTEE'S SALE YOU
ARE IN DEFAULT UN-
DER A DEED OF TRUST
DATED 06/16/2006. UN-
LESS YOU TAKE AC-
T I O N T O P R O T E C T
YOUR PROPERTY, IT
MAY BE SOLD AT A PUB-
LIC SALE. IF YOU NEED
AN EXPLANATION OF
THE NATURE OF THE
PROCEEDING AGAINST
Y O U , Y O U S H O U L D
CONTACT A LAWYER.
NBS Default Services,
LLC, as the duly appoin-
ted Trustee, under and
pursuant to the power of
sale contained in that cer-
tain Deed of Trust Recor-
ded 06/21/2006 as Docu-
m e n t N o . :
2006000416509, of Offi-
cial Records in the office
of the Recorder of Orange
County, California, ex-
ecuted by: MARTHA E
GODOY, A MARRIED
WOMAN AS HER SOLE
AND SEPARATE PROP-
ERTY, as Trustor, WILL
SELL AT PUBLIC AUC-
TION TO THE HIGHEST
BIDDER FOR CASH (pay-
able in full at time of sale
by cash, a cashier's check
drawn by a state or nation-
al bank, a check drawn by
a state or federal credit
union, or a check drawn by
a state or federal savings
and loan association, sav-
ings association, or sav-
ings bank specified in sec-
tion 5102 of the Financial
Code and authorized to do
business in this state). All
right, title and interest con-
veyed to and now held by
it under said Deed of Trust
in the property situated in
said County and state, and
as more fully described in
the above referenced
Deed of Trust. Sale Date &
Time: 10/17/2022 at 9:00
AM Sale Location: Auc-
tion.com Room Double-
tree by Hilton Hotel Ana-
heim - Orange County,
100 The City Drive, Or-
ange, CA 92868 The
street address and other
common designation, if
any, of the real property
described above is purpor-
ted to be: 1916 W ELM
PLACE, ANAHEIM, CA
92804-2554 The under-
signed Trustee disclaims
any liability for any incor-
rectness of the street ad-
dress and other common
designation, if any, shown
herein. Said sale will be
made in an “AS IS” condi-
tion, but without covenant
or warranty, expressed or
implied, regarding title,
possession, or encum-
brances, to pay the re-
maining principal sum of
the note(s) secured by
said Deed of Trust, with in-
terest thereon, as provided
in said note(s), advances,
if any, under the terms of
the Deed of Trust, estim-
ated fees, charges and ex-
penses of the Trustee and
of the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust, to-wit:
$580,311.46 (Estimated).
Accrued interest and addi-
tional advances, if any, will
increase this figure prior to
sale. It is possible that at
the time of sale the open-
ing bid may be less than
the total indebtedness
due. NOTICE TO POTEN-
TIAL BIDDERS: If you are
considering bidding on this
property lien, you should
understand that there are
risks involved in bidding at
a trustee auction. You will
be bidding on a lien, not
on the property itself. Pla-
cing the highest bid at a
trustee auction does not
automatically entitle you to
free and clear ownership
o f the proper ty . You
should also be aware that
the lien being auctioned off
may be a junior lien. If you
are the highest bidder at
the auction, you are or
may be responsible for
paying off all liens senior
to the lien being auctioned
off, before you can re-
ceive clear tit le to the
property. You are encour-
aged to investigate the ex-
istence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens that
may exist on this property
by contacting the county
recorder’s office or a title
insurance company, either
of which may charge you a
fee for this information. If
you consult either of these
resources, you should be
aware that the same
lender may hold more than
one mortgage or deed of
trust on the property. NO-
TICE TO PROPERTY
OWNER: The sale date
shown on this notice of
sale may be postponed
one or more times by the
mortgagee, beneficiary,
trustee, or a court, pursu-
ant to Section 2924g of the
California Civil Code. The
law requires that informa-
tion about trustee sale
postponements be made
available to you and to the
public, as a courtesy to
those not present at the
sale. If you wish to learn
whether your sale date
has been postponed, and,
if applicable, the resched-
uled time and date for the
sale of this property, you
may call 1-800-280-2832
or visit this internet web-
site, www.auction.com, us-
ing the file number as-
signed to this case T.S.#
9462-5167. Information
about postponements that
are very short in duration
or that occur close in time
to the scheduled sale may
not immediately be reflec-
ted in the telephone in-
formation or on the inter-
net website. The best way
to verify postponement in-
formation is to attend the
scheduled sale. NOTICE
TO TENANT: You may
have a right to purchase
this property after the
trustee auction pursuant to
Section 2924m of the Cali-
fornia Civil Code. If you
are an “eligible tenant buy-
er,” you can purchase the
property if you match the
last and highest bid placed
at the trustee auction. If
you a re an “e l i g i b l e
bidder,” you may be able
to purchase the property if
you exceed the last and
highest bid placed at the
trustee auction. There are
three steps to exercising
this right of purchase.
First, 48 hours after the
date of the trustee sale,
you can call 855-976-
3916, or visit this internet
website https://tracker.auc-
tion.com/sb1079/, using
the file number assigned
to this case T.S.# 9462-
5167 to find the date on
which the trustee’s sale
was held, the amount of
the last and highest bid,
and the address of the
trustee. Second, you must
send a written notice of in-
tent to place a bid so that
the trustee receives it no
more than 15 days after
the trustee’s sale. Third,
you must submit a bid so
that the trustee receives it
no more than 45 days after
the trustee’s sale. If you
think you may qualify as
an “eligible tenant buyer”
or “eligible bidder,” you
should consider contact-
ing an attorney or appro-
priate real estate profes-
sional immediately for ad-
vice regarding this poten-
tial right to purchase. If the
Trustee is unable to con-
vey title for any reason,
the successful bidder’s
sole and exclusive rem-
edy shall be the return of
monies paid to the Trust-
ee and the successful bid-
der shall have no further
recourse. NBS Default
Services, LLC 14841 Dal-
las Parkway, Suite 425
Dallas, TX 75254 800-766-
7751 For Trustee Sale In-
format ion Log On To:
www.auction.com or Call:
1-800-280-2832. NBS De-
fault Services, LLC, James
Aranda, Foreclosure Asso-
ciate This communication
is an attempt to collect a
debt and any information
obtained will be used for
that purpose. However, if
you have received a dis-
charge of the debt refer-
enced herein in a bank-
ruptcy proceeding, this is
not an attempt to impose
personal liability upon you
for payment of that debt. In
the event you have re-
ceived a bankruptcy dis-
charge, any action to en-
force the debt will be taken
against the property only.
NPP0415824 To: INDE-
PENDENT 09/21/2022,
09/28/2022, 10/05/2022
Anaheim  Independent
9/21,28,10/5/22-123039
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NOTICE OF
PETITION TO
ADMINISTER
 ESTATE OF:
LU-YEE YU
CASE NO.

30-2022-01279837-PR-
LA-CJC

To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors, contingent cred-
itors, and persons who
may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate,
or both, of LU-YEE YU.
A Petition for PROBATE
has been filed by: ANNE
CHANG in the Superior
Court of California, County
of ORANGE.
The Petition for Probate
r e q u e s t s t h a t A N N E
CHANG be appointed as
personal representative to
administer the estate of
the decedent.
The petition requests au-
thority to administer the
estate under the Inde-
pendent Administration of
Estates Act. (This author-
ity will allow the personal
representat ive to take
many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Be-
fore taking certain very im-
portant actions, however,
the personal representat-
ive will be required to give
notice to interested per-
sons unless they have
waived notice or consen-
ted to the p roposed
action.) The independent
administration authority
will be granted unless an
interested person files an
objection to the petition
and shows good cause
why the court should not
grant the authority.
A  hearing  on  the  peti-
tion  will  be  held  in  this
court  as  follows:  NOV
03,  2022  at  1:30  PM in
Dept. C8, 700 Civic Cen-
ter Dr., West, Santa Ana,
CA 92701.
The court is providing the
convenience to appear for
hearing by video using the
court’s designated video
platform. This is a no cost
service to the public. Go to
the Court’s website at The
Superior Court of Califor-
nia - County of Orange
(occourts.org) to appear
remotely for Probate hear-
ings and for remote hear-
ing instructions. If you
have difficulty connecting
or are unable to connect to
your remote hearing, call
657-622-8278 for assist-
ance. If you prefer to ap-
pear in-person, you can
appear in the department
on the day/time set for
your hearing.
If you object to the grant-
ing of the petition, you
should appear at the hear-
ing and state your objec-
tions or file written objec-
tions with the court before
the hearing. Your appear-
ance may be in person or
by your attorney.
If you are a creditor or a
contingent creditor of the
decedent, you must file
your claim with the court
and mail a copy to the per-
sonal representative ap-
pointed by the court within
the later of either (1) four
months from the date of
first issuance of letters to a
general personal repres-
entative, as defined in sec-
tion 58(b) of the California
Probate Code, or (2) 60
days from the date of mail-
ing or personal delivery to
you of a notice under sec-
tion 9052 of the California
Probate Code. Other Cali-
fornia statutes and legal
authority may affect your
rights as a creditor. You
may want to consult with
an attorney knowledge-
able in California law.
You may examine the file
kept by the court. If you
are a person interested in
the estate, you may file
with the court a Request
for Special Notice (form
DE-154) of the filing of an
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any pe-
t i t i on o r accoun t as
provided in Probate Code
section 1250. A Request
for Special Notice form is
available from the court
clerk.
Attorney for petit ioner:
PAUL S. RABER, ESQ
ATTORNEY AT LAW
115 S . CHAPARRAL
COURT #100, ANAHEIM,
CA 92808. (714) 521-0611
Buena Park/Anaheim
I n d e p e n d e n t
9 / 1 6 , 9 / 2 1 , 9 / 2 3 / 2 0 2 2 -
1 2 2 9 8 6

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
30-2022-01279596

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Pet i t ioner:
JOOHEE KIM filed a peti-
tion with this court for a
decree changing names
as follows: JOOHEE KIM
to JULIE JOOHEE KIM.
THE COURT ORDERS
that all persons interested
in this matter shall appear
before this court at the
hearing indicated below to
show cause, if any, why
the petition for change of
name should not be gran-
ted. Any person objecting
to the name changes de-
scribed above must file a
written objection that in-
cludes the reasons for the
objection at least two court
days before the matter is
scheduled to be heard and
must appear at the hear-
ing to show cause why the
petit ion should not be
granted. If no written ob-
jection is timely filed, the
court may grant the peti-
tion without a hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING
11/17/2022, 8:30 a.m.

D100 REMOTE
Central Justice Center
700 Civic Center Drive

West
Santa Ana, CA 92701

A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be pub-
lished at least once each
week for four successive
weeks prior to the date set
for hearing on the petition
in the following newspa-
per of general circulation,
printed in this county:
Anaheim Independent
Date: 9/09/2022
Judge Layne H Melzer
Judge of the Superior
Court

Anaheim Independent
9/14,21,28,10/5/22-

122966

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
30-2022-01278427

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Pet i t ioner:
GABRIEL ALEXANDER
BLINKENBERG filed a pe-
tition with this court for a
decree changing names
as follows: GABRIEL AL-
EXANDER BLINKEN-
BERG to GABRIEL ALEX-
ANDER BLUHM. THE
COURT ORDERS that all
persons interested in this
matter shall appear before
this court at the hearing in-
dicated below to show
cause, if any, why the peti-
tion for change of name
should not be granted. Any
person objecting to the
name changes described
above must file a written
objection that includes the
reasons for the objection
at least two court days be-
fore the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and must
appear at the hearing to
show cause why the peti-
tion should not be granted.
If no written objection is
timely filed, the court may
grant the petition without a
hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING
11/15/2022, 8:30 a.m.

D100 REMOTE
Central Justice Center
700 Civic Center Drive

West
Santa Ana, CA 92701

A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be pub-
lished at least once each
week for four successive
weeks prior to the date set
for hearing on the petition
in the following newspa-
per of general circulation,
printed in this county:
Independent
Date: 9/02/2022
Judge Walter P Schwarm
Judge of the Superior
Court

Anaheim Independent
9/21,28,10/5,12/22-

122995
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NOTICE OF
PETITION TO
ADMINISTER
 ESTATE OF:
LU-YEE YU
CASE NO.

30-2022-01279837-PR-
LA-CJC

To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors, contingent cred-
itors, and persons who
may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate,
or both, of LU-YEE YU.
A Petition for PROBATE
has been filed by: ANNE
CHANG in the Superior
Court of California, County
of ORANGE.
The Petition for Probate
r e q u e s t s t h a t A N N E
CHANG be appointed as
personal representative to
administer the estate of
the decedent.
The petition requests au-
thority to administer the
estate under the Inde-
pendent Administration of
Estates Act. (This author-
ity will allow the personal
representat ive to take
many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Be-
fore taking certain very im-
portant actions, however,
the personal representat-
ive will be required to give
notice to interested per-
sons unless they have
waived notice or consen-
ted to the p roposed
action.) The independent
administration authority
will be granted unless an
interested person files an
objection to the petition
and shows good cause
why the court should not
grant the authority.
A  hearing  on  the  peti-
tion  will  be  held  in  this
court  as  follows:  NOV
03,  2022  at  1:30  PM in
Dept. C8, 700 Civic Cen-
ter Dr., West, Santa Ana,
CA 92701.
The court is providing the
convenience to appear for
hearing by video using the
court’s designated video
platform. This is a no cost
service to the public. Go to
the Court’s website at The
Superior Court of Califor-
nia - County of Orange
(occourts.org) to appear
remotely for Probate hear-
ings and for remote hear-
ing instructions. If you
have difficulty connecting
or are unable to connect to
your remote hearing, call
657-622-8278 for assist-
ance. If you prefer to ap-
pear in-person, you can
appear in the department
on the day/time set for
your hearing.
If you object to the grant-
ing of the petition, you
should appear at the hear-
ing and state your objec-
tions or file written objec-
tions with the court before
the hearing. Your appear-
ance may be in person or
by your attorney.
If you are a creditor or a
contingent creditor of the
decedent, you must file
your claim with the court
and mail a copy to the per-
sonal representative ap-
pointed by the court within
the later of either (1) four
months from the date of
first issuance of letters to a
general personal repres-
entative, as defined in sec-
tion 58(b) of the California
Probate Code, or (2) 60
days from the date of mail-
ing or personal delivery to
you of a notice under sec-
tion 9052 of the California
Probate Code. Other Cali-
fornia statutes and legal
authority may affect your
rights as a creditor. You
may want to consult with
an attorney knowledge-
able in California law.
You may examine the file
kept by the court. If you
are a person interested in
the estate, you may file
with the court a Request
for Special Notice (form
DE-154) of the filing of an
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any pe-
t i t i on o r accoun t a s
provided in Probate Code
section 1250. A Request
for Special Notice form is
available from the court
clerk.
Attorney for petit ioner:
PAUL S. RABER, ESQ
ATTORNEY AT LAW
115 S . CHAPARRAL
COURT #100, ANAHEIM,
CA 92808. (714) 521-0611
Buena Park/Anaheim
I n d e p e n d e n t
9 / 1 6 , 9 / 2 1 , 9 / 2 3 / 2 0 2 2 -
1 2 2 9 8 6



T.S. No.: 2020-01589-
CA           
   

A.P.N.:128-385-03
Property Address: 1768 
WEST CHALET AVENUE, 

ANAHEIM, CA 92804

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S 
SALE

PURSUANT TO CIVIL 
CODE § 2923.3(a) and (d), 
THE SUMMARY OF IN-
FORMATION REFERRED 
TO BELOW IS NOT AT-
TACHED TO THE RE-
CORDED COPY OF THIS 
DOCUMENT BUT ONLY 
TO THE COPIES PROVID-
ED TO THE TRUSTOR. 

NOTE: THERE IS A SUM-
MARY OF THE INFORMA-
TION IN THIS DOCUMENT 
ATTACHED 

注：本文件包含一个信息
摘要
참고사항: 본 첨부 문서에 
정보 요약서가 있습니다 
NOTA: SE ADJUNTA UN 
RESUMEN DE LA INFOR-
MACIÓN DE ESTE DOCU-
MENTO
TALA: MAYROONG BUOD 
NG IMPORMASYON SA 
DOKUMENTONG ITO NA 
NAKALAKIP 
LƯU Ý: KÈM THEO ĐÂY 
LÀ BẢN TRÌNH BÀY TÓM 
LƯỢC VỀ THÔNG TIN 
TRONG TÀI LIỆU NÀY

IMPORTANT NOTICE TO 
PROPERTY OWNER: 
YOU ARE IN DEFAULT UN-
DER A DEED OF TRUST 
DATED 07/26/2005. UN-
LESS YOU TAKE ACTION 
TO PROTECT YOUR 
PROPERTY, IT MAY BE 
SOLD AT A PUBLIC SALE. 
IF YOU NEED AN EXPLA-
NATION OF THE NATURE 
OF THE PROCEEDING 
AGAINST YOU, YOU 
SHOULD CONTACT A 
LAWYER.

Trustor: DOLORES C 
ROSENBERG, A MARRIED 
WOMAN, AS HER SOLE 
AND SEPERATE PROP-
ERTY

Duly Appointed Trustee: 
Western Progressive, LLC
Deed of Trust Recorded 
08/01/2005 as Instrument 
No. 2005000593476 in book 
---, page--- and of Official 
Records in the office of the 
Recorder of Orange County, 
California, 
Date of Sale: 10/31/2022 at 
09:00 AM
Place of Sale: A U C -
TION.COM ROOM, DOU-
BLETREE BY HILTON 
HOTEL ANAHEIM - OR-
ANGE COUNTY, 100 THE 
CITY DRIVE, ORANGE, CA 
92868

Estimated amount of un-
paid balance, reasonably 
estimated costs and other 
charges: $ 511,571.85

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S 
SALE

THE TRUSTEE WILL SELL 
AT PUBLIC AUCTION 
TO HIGHEST BIDDER 
FOR CASH, CASHIER’S 
CHECK DRAWN ON A 
STATE OR NATIONAL 
BANK, A CHECK DRAWN 
BY A STATE OR FEDER-
AL CREDIT UNION, OR 
A CHECK DRAWN BY A 
STATE OR FEDERAL SAV-
INGS AND LOAN ASSO-
CIATION, A SAVINGS AS-
SOCIATION OR SAVINGS 
BANK SPECIFIED IN SEC-
TION 5102 OF THE FINAN-
CIAL CODE AND AUTHO-
RIZED TO DO BUSINESS 
IN THIS STATE:

All right, title, and interest 
conveyed to and now held 
by the trustee in the herein-
after described property un-
der and pursuant to a Deed 
of Trust described as:

More fully described in said 
Deed of Trust.

Street Address or other 
common designation of real 
property: 1768 WEST CHA-
LET AVENUE, ANAHEIM, 
CA 92804 
A.P.N.: 128-385-03

The undersigned Trustee 
disclaims any liability for any 
incorrectness of the street 
address or other common 
designation, if any, shown 
above.

The sale will be made, but 
without covenant or war-
ranty, expressed or implied, 
regarding title, possession, 
or encumbrances, to pay the 
remaining principal sum of 
the note(s) secured by the 
Deed of Trust with interest 
thereon, as provided in said 
note(s), advances, under the 
terms of said Deed of Trust, 
fees, charges and expenses 
of the Trustee and of the 
trusts created by said Deed 
of Trust. The total amount 
of the unpaid balance of the 
obligation secured by the 
property to be sold and rea-
sonable estimated costs, ex-
penses and advances at the 
time of the initial publication 
of the Notice of Sale is: 
$ 511,571.85.

Note: Because the Ben-
eficiary reserves the right 
to bid less than the total 
debt owed, it is possible 
that at the time of the sale 
the opening bid may be less 
than the total debt.

If the Trustee is unable to 
convey title for any reason, 
the successful bidder’s sole 
and exclusive remedy shall 
be the return of monies paid 
to the Trustee, and the suc-
cessful bidder shall have no 
further recourse.

The beneficiary of the Deed 
of Trust has executed and 
delivered to the undersigned 
a written request to com-
mence foreclosure, and the 
undersigned caused a No-
tice of Default and Election 
to Sell to be recorded in the 
county where the real prop-
erty is located. 
 

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S 
SALE

NOTICE TO POTENTIAL 
BIDDERS:  If you are con-
sidering bidding on this 
property lien, you should 
understand that there are 
risks involved in bidding at 
a trustee auction. You will be 
bidding on a lien, not on the 
property itself.  Placing the 
highest bid at a trustee auc-
tion does not automatically 
entitle you to free and clear 
ownership of the property. 
You should also be aware 
that the lien being auctioned 
off may be a junior lien. If 
you are the highest bid-
der at the auction, you are 
or may be responsible for 
paying off all liens senior to 
the lien being auctioned off, 
before you can receive clear 
title to the property. You are 
encouraged to investigate 
the existence, priority, and 
size of outstanding liens 
that may exist on this prop-
erty by contacting the county 
recorder’s office or a title 
insurance company, either 
of which may charge you 
a fee for this information. If 
you consult either of these 
resources, you should be 
aware that the same lender 
may hold more than one 
mortgage or deed of trust on 
this property.

NOTICE TO PROPERTY 
OWNER:  The sale date 
shown on this notice of 
sale may be postponed 
one or more times by the 
mortgagee, beneficiary, 
trustee, or a court, pursu-
ant to Section 2924g of the 
California Civil Code. The 
law requires that information 
about trustee sale postpone-
ments be made available to 
you and to the public, as a 
courtesy to those not pres-
ent at the sale. If you wish 
to learn whether your sale 
date has been postponed, 
and, if applicable, the re-
scheduled time and date for 
the sale of this property, you 
may call (866)-960-8299 or 
visit this Internet Web site 
https://www.altisource.com/
loginpage.aspx  using the 
file number assigned to this 
case 2020-01589-CA. In-
formation about postpone-
ments that are very short in 
duration or that occur close 
in time to the scheduled 
sale may not immediately 
be reflected in the telephone 
information or on the In-
ternet Web site.  The best 
way to verify postponement 
information is to attend the 

scheduled sale.

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S 
SALE
 
 
NOTICE TO TENANT: You 
may have a right to pur-
chase this property after the 
trustee auction, if conducted 
after January 1, 2021, pur-
suant to Section 2924m of 
the California Civil Code. If 
you are an “eligible tenant 
buyer,” you can purchase 
the property if you match the 
last and highest bid placed 
at the trustee auction. If you 
are an “eligible bidder,” you 
may be able to purchase the 
property if you exceed the 
last and highest bid placed 
at the trustee auction. There 
are three steps to exercis-
ing this right of purchase. 
First, 48 hours after the date 
of the trustee sale, you can 
call (855)-976-3916, or visit 
this internet website https://
tracker.auction.com/sb1079, 
using the file number as-
signed to this case 2020-
01589-CA  to find the date 
on which the trustee’s sale 
was held, the amount of the 
last and highest bid, and the 
address of the trustee. Sec-
ond, you must send a written 
notice of intent to place a bid 
so that the trustee receives 
it no more than 15 days af-
ter the trustee’s sale. Third, 
you must submit a bid, by 
remitting the funds and af-
fidavit described in Section 
2924m(c) of the Civil Code, 
so that the trustee receives 
it no more than 45 days af-
ter the trustee’s sale. If you 
think you may qualify as an 
“eligible tenant buyer” or 
“eligible bidder,” you should 
consider contacting an attor-
ney or appropriate real es-
tate professional immediate-
ly for advice regarding this 
potential right to purchase.

Date: September 9, 2022 
Western Progressive, LLC, 
as Trustee for beneficiary
C/o 1500 Palma Drive, Suite 
238
Ventura, CA 93003
Sale Information Line: (866) 
960-8299 https://www.alti-
source.com/loginpage.aspx

         __________________
______________________
________
             Trustee Sale As-
sistant

WESTERN PROGRES-
SIVE, LLC MAY BE ACT-
ING AS A DEBT COLLEC-
TOR ATTEMPTING TO 
COLLECT A DEBT. ANY 
INFORMATION OBTAINED 
MAY BE USED FOR THAT 
PURPOSE.

Anaheim Independent 
9/14,21,28/2022-122967

Legals-IND

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT

NO. 20226643493
a)  FAM  FAM  b)  JR  IN-
VESTMENT, Located at:
1250 N LAKEVIEW AVE
SUITE J, ANAHEIM, CA
92807-9280. County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment. Registrant(s): ASIS
FASHION INC, 1250 N
LAKEVIEW AVE SUITE J,
ANAHEIM, CA 92807.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. Regis-
trant(s): /s/ YUNSHEN
WU, CHIEF FINANCIAL
OFFICER. I declare that
all information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 9 / 0 6 / 2 0 2 2 .

Buena Park/Anaheim
Independent

9/21,28,105,12/22-123114

Legals-IND

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT

NO. 20226643693
ANAHEIM  COTTAGES,
Located at: 2544 W WIN-
STON RD, ANAHEIM, CA
92804. County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
Registrant(s): WINSTON
PARK HOMES, INC. ,
1000 NORTH POINT,
#1801, SAN FRANCISCO,
CA 94109. Have you star-
ted doing business yet?
YES, 10/01/2012. This
business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. Regis-
trant(s): /s/ ROBERT A.
VALLARINO, PRESID-
ENT. I declare that all in-
formation in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 9 / 0 7 / 2 0 2 2 .

Buena Park/Anaheim
Independent

9/21,28,105,12/22-123113

Legals-IND

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT

NO. 20226644312
CHICKN'DALES, Located
at: 3210 W. BALL RD,
ANAHEIM, CA 92804.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
t r a n t ( s ) : D . H . & K I D Z ,
18700 BEACH BLVD
SUITE 150, HUNTING-
TON BEACH, CA 92648.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. Regis-
trant(s): /s/ DALE MOR-
ALES, CHIEF EXECUT-
IVE OFFICER. I declare
that all information in this
statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information
which he or she knows to
be false is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk
of Orange County on
09/15/2022.

Buena Park/Anaheim
Independent

9/21,28,105,12/22-123112

Legals-IND

SUMMONS
(CITACION JUDICIAL)

CASE NUMBER
(Numero del Caso)

30-2021-01234810-CU-
PO-CJC

NOTICE TO
DEFENDANT:

(Aviso al Demandado):
YOUNG CHAE, an indi-

vidual; and DOES 1
through 100, inclusive,
YOU ARE BEING SUED

BY PLAINTIFF:
(Lo esta demandando el

demandante)
HAPPY POOLS, INC, a
California corporation,

NOTICE! You have been
sued. The court may de-
cide against you without
your being heard unless
you respond within 30
days. Read the informa-
tion below.
You have 30 calendar
days after this summons
and legal papers are
served on you to file a writ-
ten response at this court
and have a copy served
on the plaintiff. A letter or
phone call will not protect
you. Your wr i t ten re-
sponse must be in proper
legal form if you want the
court to hear your case.
There may be a court form
that you can use for your
response. You can find
these court forms and
more information at the
California Courts Online
Self-Help Center (www.
courtinfo.ca.gov/ selfhelp),
your county law library, or
the courthouse nearest
you. If you cannot pay the
filing fee, ask the court
clerk for a fee waiver form.
If you do not file your re-
sponse on time, you may
lose the case by default,
and your wages, money,
and property may be taken
without further warning
from the court.
There are other legal re-
quirements. You may want
to call an attorney right
away. If you do not know
an attorney, you may want
to call an attorney referral
service. If you cannot af-
ford an attorney, you may
be eligible for free legal
services from a nonprofit
legal services program.
You can locate these non-
profit groups at the Califor-
nia Legal Services Web
site (www.law helpcalifor-
nia.org), the California
Courts Online Self-Help
Center (www.courtinfo.ca.
gov/selfhelp), or by con-
tacting your local court of
county bar association.
NOTE: The court has a
statutory lien for waived
fees and costs on any set-
t lement or arb i t ra t ion
award of $10,000.00 or
more in a civil case. The
court's lien must be paid
before the court will dis-
miss the case.
A V I S O ! L o h a n d e -
mandado. Si no responde
dentro de 30 dias, la corte
puede decidir en su con-
tra sin escuchar su ver-
sion. Lea la informacion a
continuacion.
Tiene 30 dias de calen-
dario despues de que le
entreguen esta citacion y
papeles lega les para
presentar una respuesta
por escrito en esta corte y
hacer que se entregue una
copia al demandante. Una
carta o una llamada tele-
fonica no lo protegen. Su
respuesta por escrito tiene
que estar en formato legal
correcto si desea que pro-
cesen su caso en la corte.
Es posible que haya un
formular lo que usted
pueda usar su repuesta.
Puede encontrar estos for-
mularios de la corte y mas
informacion en el Centro
de Ayunda de las Cortes
de California (www.su-
corte.ca.gov), en la bibli-
oteca de leyes de su
condado o en la corte que
le quede mas cerca. Si no
puede pagar la cuota de
presentacion, pida al sec-
retario de la corte que le
de un formularlo de exen-
cion de pago de cuotas. Si
no presenta su respuesta
a tiempo, puede perder el
caso por incumplimiento y
la corte le podra quitar su
sueldo, dinero y blenes sin
mas advertencia.
Hay otros requisitos le-
gales. Es recomendable
que llame a un abogado
inmediatamente. Si no
conoce a un abogado,
puede llamar a un servicio
de remision a abogados.
Si no puede pagar a un
abogado, es posible que
cumpla con los requisitos
para obtener servicios le-
gales gratuitos de un pro-
grama de servicios le-
gales sin fines de lucro.
Puede encontrar estos
grupos sin fines de lucro
en el sitio web de Califor-
n i a L e g a l S e r v i c e s ,
(www.lawhelpcalifornia,org
), en el Centro de Ayunda
de las Cortes de Califor-
nia, (www.sucorte.ca.gov)
o poniendose en contacto
con la corte o el colegio de
abogados locales.
AVISO: Por ley, la corte
tiene derecho a reclamar
las cuotas y los costos ex-
entos por imponer un
gravamen sobre cualquier
r e c u p e r a c i o n d e
$10,000.00 o mas de val-
or recibida mediante un
acuerdo o una concesion
de arbitraje en un caso de
derecho civil. Tiene que
pagar el gravamen de la
corte antes de que la corte
pueda desechar el caso.
The name and address of
the court is (El nombre y
dirección de la corte es):
Superior Court of Califor-
nia, County of Orange,
Central Justice Center,
700 Civic Center Drive,
Santa Ana, CA 92701.
The name, address, and
te lephone number o f
plaint i f f ’s at torney, or
plaintiff without an attor-
n e y , i s ( E l n o m b r e ,
dirección y el número de
teléfono del abogado del
demandante, o del de-
mandante que no tiene
abogado, es): Frederick
W. Lee, 500 N State Col-
lege Blvd, Suite 1200, Or-
ange, CA 92868. 714-634-
1234
Date:12/06/2021
David H. Yamasaki, Clerk
of the Court
Clerk, by (Secretario)
Hailey McMaster
Deputy (Adjunto)
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON SERVED: You are
served

Independent
9/21,28,10/5,12/2022-

123070

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT

NO. 20226643098
GLAM LAB OC, Located
at: 13532 LORETTA DR,
T U S T I N , C A 9 2 7 8 0 .
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
trant(s): JENNIFER NEW-
COMER, 13532 LOR-
ETTA DR, TUSTIN, CA
92780. Have you started
doing business yet? YES,
08/29/2022. This business
is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. Registrant(s): /s/
JENNIFER NEWCOMER.
I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 8 / 3 0 / 2 0 2 2 .

Buena Park/Anaheim
Independent

9/7,14,21,28/22-122708

Legals-IND

SUMMONS
(CITACION JUDICIAL)

CASE NUMBER
(Numero del Caso)

30-2021-01234810-CU-
PO-CJC

NOTICE TO
DEFENDANT:

(Aviso al Demandado):
YOUNG CHAE, an indi-

vidual; and DOES 1
through 100, inclusive,
YOU ARE BEING SUED

BY PLAINTIFF:
(Lo esta demandando el

demandante)
HAPPY POOLS, INC, a
California corporation,

NOTICE! You have been
sued. The court may de-
cide against you without
your being heard unless
you respond within 30
days. Read the informa-
tion below.
You have 30 calendar
days after this summons
and legal papers are
served on you to file a writ-
ten response at this court
and have a copy served
on the plaintiff. A letter or
phone call will not protect
you. Your wr i t ten re-
sponse must be in proper
legal form if you want the
court to hear your case.
There may be a court form
that you can use for your
response. You can find
these court forms and
more information at the
California Courts Online
Self-Help Center (www.
courtinfo.ca.gov/ selfhelp),
your county law library, or
the courthouse nearest
you. If you cannot pay the
filing fee, ask the court
clerk for a fee waiver form.
If you do not file your re-
sponse on time, you may
lose the case by default,
and your wages, money,
and property may be taken
without further warning
from the court.
There are other legal re-
quirements. You may want
to call an attorney right
away. If you do not know
an attorney, you may want
to call an attorney referral
service. If you cannot af-
ford an attorney, you may
be eligible for free legal
services from a nonprofit
legal services program.
You can locate these non-
profit groups at the Califor-
nia Legal Services Web
site (www.law helpcalifor-
nia.org), the California
Courts Online Self-Help
Center (www.courtinfo.ca.
gov/selfhelp), or by con-
tacting your local court of
county bar association.
NOTE: The court has a
statutory lien for waived
fees and costs on any set-
t lement or arb i t ra t ion
award of $10,000.00 or
more in a civil case. The
court's lien must be paid
before the court will dis-
miss the case.
A V I S O ! L o h a n d e -
mandado. Si no responde
dentro de 30 dias, la corte
puede decidir en su con-
tra sin escuchar su ver-
sion. Lea la informacion a
continuacion.
Tiene 30 dias de calen-
dario despues de que le
entreguen esta citacion y
papeles lega les para
presentar una respuesta
por escrito en esta corte y
hacer que se entregue una
copia al demandante. Una
carta o una llamada tele-
fonica no lo protegen. Su
respuesta por escrito tiene
que estar en formato legal
correcto si desea que pro-
cesen su caso en la corte.
Es posible que haya un
formular lo que usted
pueda usar su repuesta.
Puede encontrar estos for-
mularios de la corte y mas
informacion en el Centro
de Ayunda de las Cortes
de California (www.su-
corte.ca.gov), en la bibli-
oteca de leyes de su
condado o en la corte que
le quede mas cerca. Si no
puede pagar la cuota de
presentacion, pida al sec-
retario de la corte que le
de un formularlo de exen-
cion de pago de cuotas. Si
no presenta su respuesta
a tiempo, puede perder el
caso por incumplimiento y
la corte le podra quitar su
sueldo, dinero y blenes sin
mas advertencia.
Hay otros requisitos le-
gales. Es recomendable
que llame a un abogado
inmediatamente. Si no
conoce a un abogado,
puede llamar a un servicio
de remision a abogados.
Si no puede pagar a un
abogado, es posible que
cumpla con los requisitos
para obtener servicios le-
gales gratuitos de un pro-
grama de servicios le-
gales sin fines de lucro.
Puede encontrar estos
grupos sin fines de lucro
en el sitio web de Califor-
n i a L e g a l S e r v i c e s ,
(www.lawhelpcalifornia,org
), en el Centro de Ayunda
de las Cortes de Califor-
nia, (www.sucorte.ca.gov)
o poniendose en contacto
con la corte o el colegio de
abogados locales.
AVISO: Por ley, la corte
tiene derecho a reclamar
las cuotas y los costos ex-
entos por imponer un
gravamen sobre cualquier
r e c u p e r a c i o n d e
$10,000.00 o mas de val-
or recibida mediante un
acuerdo o una concesion
de arbitraje en un caso de
derecho civil. Tiene que
pagar el gravamen de la
corte antes de que la corte
pueda desechar el caso.
The name and address of
the court is (El nombre y
dirección de la corte es):
Superior Court of Califor-
nia, County of Orange,
Central Justice Center,
700 Civic Center Drive,
Santa Ana, CA 92701.
The name, address, and
te lephone number o f
plaint i f f ’s at torney, or
plaintiff without an attor-
n e y , i s ( E l n o m b r e ,
dirección y el número de
teléfono del abogado del
demandante, o del de-
mandante que no tiene
abogado, es): Frederick
W. Lee, 500 N State Col-
lege Blvd, Suite 1200, Or-
ange, CA 92868. 714-634-
1234
Date:12/06/2021
David H. Yamasaki, Clerk
of the Court
Clerk, by (Secretario)
Hailey McMaster
Deputy (Adjunto)
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON SERVED: You are
served

Independent
9/21,28,10/5,12/2022-

123070

Legals-IND

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
30-2022-01279784

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Pet i t ioner:
DAEYOUNG KIM filed a
petition with this court for a
decree changing names
as follows: DAEYOUNG
K I M t o A N T O N I O
DAEYOUNG KIM THE
COURT ORDERS that all
persons interested in this
matter shall appear before
this court at the hearing in-
dicated below to show
cause, if any, why the peti-
tion for change of name
should not be granted. Any
person objecting to the
name changes described
above must file a written
objection that includes the
reasons for the objection
at least two court days be-
fore the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and must
appear at the hearing to
show cause why the peti-
tion should not be granted.
If no written objection is
timely filed, the court may
grant the petition without a
hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING
11/22/2022, 8:30 a.m.

D100 REMOTE
Central Justice Center
700 Civic Center Drive

West
Santa Ana, CA 92701

A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be pub-
lished at least once each
week for four successive
weeks prior to the date set
for hearing on the petition
in the following newspa-
per of general circulation,
printed in this county:
Anaheim Independent
Date: 9/12/2022
Judge Layne H Melzer
Judge of the Superior
Court

Anaheim Independent
9/21,28,10/5,12/22-

123043

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT

NO. 20226644231
a)  QUEENS  INN  ANA-
HEIM b) QUEENS  INN,
Located at: 620 W. OR-
ANGEWOOD AVE, ANA-
HEIM, CA 92802. County:
Orange. This is a New
Statement. Registrant(s):
ANAHEIM HOTEL HOLD-
INGS LLC, 620 W. OR-
ANGEWOOD AVE, ANA-
HEIM, CA 92802. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by: LIM-
ITED LIABILITY CO. Re-
gistrant(s): /s/ NEELESH
BHAGAT, MANAGING
MEMBER/MANAGER. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 9 / 1 4 / 2 0 2 2 .

Buena Park/Anaheim
Independent

9/21,28,105,12/22-123062

SUMMONS
(CITACION JUDICIAL)

CASE NUMBER
(Numero del Caso)

30-2021-01234810-CU-
PO-CJC

NOTICE TO
DEFENDANT:

(Aviso al Demandado):
YOUNG CHAE, an indi-

vidual; and DOES 1
through 100, inclusive,
YOU ARE BEING SUED

BY PLAINTIFF:
(Lo esta demandando el

demandante)
HAPPY POOLS, INC, a
California corporation,

NOTICE! You have been
sued. The court may de-
cide against you without
your being heard unless
you respond within 30
days. Read the informa-
tion below.
You have 30 calendar
days after this summons
and legal papers are
served on you to file a writ-
ten response at this court
and have a copy served
on the plaintiff. A letter or
phone call will not protect
you. Your wr i t ten re-
sponse must be in proper
legal form if you want the
court to hear your case.
There may be a court form
that you can use for your
response. You can find
these court forms and
more information at the
California Courts Online
Self-Help Center (www.
courtinfo.ca.gov/ selfhelp),
your county law library, or
the courthouse nearest
you. If you cannot pay the
filing fee, ask the court
clerk for a fee waiver form.
If you do not file your re-
sponse on time, you may
lose the case by default,
and your wages, money,
and property may be taken
without further warning
from the court.
There are other legal re-
quirements. You may want
to call an attorney right
away. If you do not know
an attorney, you may want
to call an attorney referral
service. If you cannot af-
ford an attorney, you may
be eligible for free legal
services from a nonprofit
legal services program.
You can locate these non-
profit groups at the Califor-
nia Legal Services Web
site (www.law helpcalifor-
nia.org), the California
Courts Online Self-Help
Center (www.courtinfo.ca.
gov/selfhelp), or by con-
tacting your local court of
county bar association.
NOTE: The court has a
statutory lien for waived
fees and costs on any set-
t lement or arb i t ra t ion
award of $10,000.00 or
more in a civil case. The
court's lien must be paid
before the court will dis-
miss the case.
A V I S O ! L o h a n d e -
mandado. Si no responde
dentro de 30 dias, la corte
puede decidir en su con-
tra sin escuchar su ver-
sion. Lea la informacion a
continuacion.
Tiene 30 dias de calen-
dario despues de que le
entreguen esta citacion y
papeles lega les para
presentar una respuesta
por escrito en esta corte y
hacer que se entregue una
copia al demandante. Una
carta o una llamada tele-
fonica no lo protegen. Su
respuesta por escrito tiene
que estar en formato legal
correcto si desea que pro-
cesen su caso en la corte.
Es posible que haya un
formular lo que usted
pueda usar su repuesta.
Puede encontrar estos for-
mularios de la corte y mas
informacion en el Centro
de Ayunda de las Cortes
de California (www.su-
corte.ca.gov), en la bibli-
oteca de leyes de su
condado o en la corte que
le quede mas cerca. Si no
puede pagar la cuota de
presentacion, pida al sec-
retario de la corte que le
de un formularlo de exen-
cion de pago de cuotas. Si
no presenta su respuesta
a tiempo, puede perder el
caso por incumplimiento y
la corte le podra quitar su
sueldo, dinero y blenes sin
mas advertencia.
Hay otros requisitos le-
gales. Es recomendable
que llame a un abogado
inmediatamente. Si no
conoce a un abogado,
puede llamar a un servicio
de remision a abogados.
Si no puede pagar a un
abogado, es posible que
cumpla con los requisitos
para obtener servicios le-
gales gratuitos de un pro-
grama de servicios le-
gales sin fines de lucro.
Puede encontrar estos
grupos sin fines de lucro
en el sitio web de Califor-
n i a L e g a l S e r v i c e s ,
(www.lawhelpcalifornia,org
), en el Centro de Ayunda
de las Cortes de Califor-
nia, (www.sucorte.ca.gov)
o poniendose en contacto
con la corte o el colegio de
abogados locales.
AVISO: Por ley, la corte
tiene derecho a reclamar
las cuotas y los costos ex-
entos por imponer un
gravamen sobre cualquier
r e c u p e r a c i o n d e
$10,000.00 o mas de val-
or recibida mediante un
acuerdo o una concesion
de arbitraje en un caso de
derecho civil. Tiene que
pagar el gravamen de la
corte antes de que la corte
pueda desechar el caso.
The name and address of
the court is (El nombre y
dirección de la corte es):
Superior Court of Califor-
nia, County of Orange,
Central Justice Center,
700 Civic Center Drive,
Santa Ana, CA 92701.
The name, address, and
te lephone number o f
plaint i f f ’s at torney, or
plaintiff without an attor-
n e y , i s ( E l n o m b r e ,
dirección y el número de
teléfono del abogado del
demandante, o del de-
mandante que no tiene
abogado, es): Frederick
W. Lee, 500 N State Col-
lege Blvd, Suite 1200, Or-
ange, CA 92868. 714-634-
1234
Date:12/06/2021
David H. Yamasaki, Clerk
of the Court
Clerk, by (Secretario)
Hailey McMaster
Deputy (Adjunto)
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON SERVED: You are
served
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T.S. No.: 9462-5167 TSG
Order No.: 210666497-
CA-VOO A.P.N.: 128-141-
1 6 N O T I C E O F
TRUSTEE'S SALE YOU
ARE IN DEFAULT UN-
DER A DEED OF TRUST
DATED 06/16/2006. UN-
LESS YOU TAKE AC-
T I O N T O P R O T E C T
YOUR PROPERTY, IT
MAY BE SOLD AT A PUB-
LIC SALE. IF YOU NEED
AN EXPLANATION OF
THE NATURE OF THE
PROCEEDING AGAINST
Y O U , Y O U S H O U L D
CONTACT A LAWYER.
NBS Default Services,
LLC, as the duly appoin-
ted Trustee, under and
pursuant to the power of
sale contained in that cer-
tain Deed of Trust Recor-
ded 06/21/2006 as Docu-
m e n t N o . :
2006000416509, of Offi-
cial Records in the office
of the Recorder of Orange
County, California, ex-
ecuted by: MARTHA E
GODOY, A MARRIED
WOMAN AS HER SOLE
AND SEPARATE PROP-
ERTY, as Trustor, WILL
SELL AT PUBLIC AUC-
TION TO THE HIGHEST
BIDDER FOR CASH (pay-
able in full at time of sale
by cash, a cashier's check
drawn by a state or nation-
al bank, a check drawn by
a state or federal credit
union, or a check drawn by
a state or federal savings
and loan association, sav-
ings association, or sav-
ings bank specified in sec-
tion 5102 of the Financial
Code and authorized to do
business in this state). All
right, title and interest con-
veyed to and now held by
it under said Deed of Trust
in the property situated in
said County and state, and
as more fully described in
the above referenced
Deed of Trust. Sale Date &
Time: 10/17/2022 at 9:00
AM Sale Location: Auc-
tion.com Room Double-
tree by Hilton Hotel Ana-
heim - Orange County,
100 The City Drive, Or-
ange, CA 92868 The
street address and other
common designation, if
any, of the real property
described above is purpor-
ted to be: 1916 W ELM
PLACE, ANAHEIM, CA
92804-2554 The under-
signed Trustee disclaims
any liability for any incor-
rectness of the street ad-
dress and other common
designation, if any, shown
herein. Said sale will be
made in an “AS IS” condi-
tion, but without covenant
or warranty, expressed or
implied, regarding title,
possession, or encum-
brances, to pay the re-
maining principal sum of
the note(s) secured by
said Deed of Trust, with in-
terest thereon, as provided
in said note(s), advances,
if any, under the terms of
the Deed of Trust, estim-
ated fees, charges and ex-
penses of the Trustee and
of the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust, to-wit:
$580,311.46 (Estimated).
Accrued interest and addi-
tional advances, if any, will
increase this figure prior to
sale. It is possible that at
the time of sale the open-
ing bid may be less than
the total indebtedness
due. NOTICE TO POTEN-
TIAL BIDDERS: If you are
considering bidding on this
property lien, you should
understand that there are
risks involved in bidding at
a trustee auction. You will
be bidding on a lien, not
on the property itself. Pla-
cing the highest bid at a
trustee auction does not
automatically entitle you to
free and clear ownership
o f the proper ty . You
should also be aware that
the lien being auctioned off
may be a junior lien. If you
are the highest bidder at
the auction, you are or
may be responsible for
paying off all liens senior
to the lien being auctioned
off, before you can re-
ceive clear tit le to the
property. You are encour-
aged to investigate the ex-
istence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens that
may exist on this property
by contacting the county
recorder’s office or a title
insurance company, either
of which may charge you a
fee for this information. If
you consult either of these
resources, you should be
aware that the same
lender may hold more than
one mortgage or deed of
trust on the property. NO-
TICE TO PROPERTY
OWNER: The sale date
shown on this notice of
sale may be postponed
one or more times by the
mortgagee, beneficiary,
trustee, or a court, pursu-
ant to Section 2924g of the
California Civil Code. The
law requires that informa-
tion about trustee sale
postponements be made
available to you and to the
public, as a courtesy to
those not present at the
sale. If you wish to learn
whether your sale date
has been postponed, and,
if applicable, the resched-
uled time and date for the
sale of this property, you
may call 1-800-280-2832
or visit this internet web-
site, www.auction.com, us-
ing the file number as-
signed to this case T.S.#
9462-5167. Information
about postponements that
are very short in duration
or that occur close in time
to the scheduled sale may
not immediately be reflec-
ted in the telephone in-
formation or on the inter-
net website. The best way
to verify postponement in-
formation is to attend the
scheduled sale. NOTICE
TO TENANT: You may
have a right to purchase
this property after the
trustee auction pursuant to
Section 2924m of the Cali-
fornia Civil Code. If you
are an “eligible tenant buy-
er,” you can purchase the
property if you match the
last and highest bid placed
at the trustee auction. If
you a re an “e l i g i b l e
bidder,” you may be able
to purchase the property if
you exceed the last and
highest bid placed at the
trustee auction. There are
three steps to exercising
this right of purchase.
First, 48 hours after the
date of the trustee sale,
you can call 855-976-
3916, or visit this internet
website https://tracker.auc-
tion.com/sb1079/, using
the file number assigned
to this case T.S.# 9462-
5167 to find the date on
which the trustee’s sale
was held, the amount of
the last and highest bid,
and the address of the
trustee. Second, you must
send a written notice of in-
tent to place a bid so that
the trustee receives it no
more than 15 days after
the trustee’s sale. Third,
you must submit a bid so
that the trustee receives it
no more than 45 days after
the trustee’s sale. If you
think you may qualify as
an “eligible tenant buyer”
or “eligible bidder,” you
should consider contact-
ing an attorney or appro-
priate real estate profes-
sional immediately for ad-
vice regarding this poten-
tial right to purchase. If the
Trustee is unable to con-
vey title for any reason,
the successful bidder’s
sole and exclusive rem-
edy shall be the return of
monies paid to the Trust-
ee and the successful bid-
der shall have no further
recourse. NBS Default
Services, LLC 14841 Dal-
las Parkway, Suite 425
Dallas, TX 75254 800-766-
7751 For Trustee Sale In-
format ion Log On To:
www.auction.com or Call:
1-800-280-2832. NBS De-
fault Services, LLC, James
Aranda, Foreclosure Asso-
ciate This communication
is an attempt to collect a
debt and any information
obtained will be used for
that purpose. However, if
you have received a dis-
charge of the debt refer-
enced herein in a bank-
ruptcy proceeding, this is
not an attempt to impose
personal liability upon you
for payment of that debt. In
the event you have re-
ceived a bankruptcy dis-
charge, any action to en-
force the debt will be taken
against the property only.
NPP0415824 To: INDE-
PENDENT 09/21/2022,
09/28/2022, 10/05/2022
Anaheim  Independent
9/21,28,10/5/22-123039

NOTICE OF PUBLIC
SALE OF

ABANDONED
 PROPERTY

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIV-
EN that the undersigned
intends to sell at public
auction pursuant to Sec-
tion 21700-21716 of the
Business & Professions
Code, Section 2328 of the
UCC, Section 535 of the
Penal Code and provi-
sions of the Civil Code of
the State of California,
identified by the tenant
name and unit number.
The units listed below may
or may not have the fol-
lowing items: furniture,
tools, personal i tems,
household items, toys,
clothes, boxes and other
misc. items.
B006 Tiffany Good Aka
Tiffany Marie Peach Good,
B156 Claudia Orantes aka
Claudia Mariela Orantes,
C047 Julio Galvan-Meza
aka Julio Cesar Galvan
Meza, D261 Scott Lopez
aka Scott Russell Lopez,
D264 Otoniel Villalobos
aka Otoniel Jr. Villalobos,
D282 Antonio Gomez,
D304 Antonio Gomez,
D380 Trevor Barner aka
Trevor Lloyd, E095 Linda
Helms aka Linda Lasater.
Public sale by competitive
bidding on or after the 27th
of September 2022 at
10:00am. The auction will
be held online at Stor-
ageTreasures.com 714-
870-5130. The property
owner reserves the right to
bid at any sale. All goods
are sold “as is” and must
be removed at the time of
purchase. This is a cash
only sale. The sale is sub-
ject to prior settlement
between landlord and ten-
ant. A refundable cleaning
deposit in the amount of
one hundred ($100) dol-
lars is required by all win-
ning bidders. The deposit
is returned after all goods
are removed and unit left
clean. Fullerton Self Stor-
age Published September
14th, and September 21st,
2022
Anaheim/Buena Park In-
dependent 9/14,21/2022-
122878

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
30-2022-01279784

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Pet i t ioner:
DAEYOUNG KIM filed a
petition with this court for a
decree changing names
as follows: DAEYOUNG
K I M t o A N T O N I O
DAEYOUNG KIM THE
COURT ORDERS that all
persons interested in this
matter shall appear before
this court at the hearing in-
dicated below to show
cause, if any, why the peti-
tion for change of name
should not be granted. Any
person objecting to the
name changes described
above must file a written
objection that includes the
reasons for the objection
at least two court days be-
fore the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and must
appear at the hearing to
show cause why the peti-
tion should not be granted.
If no written objection is
timely filed, the court may
grant the petition without a
hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING
11/22/2022, 8:30 a.m.

D100 REMOTE
Central Justice Center
700 Civic Center Drive

West
Santa Ana, CA 92701

A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be pub-
lished at least once each
week for four successive
weeks prior to the date set
for hearing on the petition
in the following newspa-
per of general circulation,
printed in this county:
Anaheim Independent
Date: 9/12/2022
Judge Layne H Melzer
Judge of the Superior
Court
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