
Legals-WHJ

STATEMENT OF
ABANDONMENT OF
USE OF FICTITIOUS

BUSINESS NAME
NO: 20246686991

ADDICTIVE  MAN,  loc-
ated at 25881 NELLIE
G A I L R D , L A G U N A
HILLS, CA 92653. The
Fictitious Business name
referred to above was filed
in Orange County on:
03/20/2024, and assigned
File No. 20246685908 Is
(are) abandoned by the
fo l l ow ing reg is t ran ts :
MARC FRANZ, 25881
NELLIE GAIL RD, LA-
GUNA HILLS, CA 92653,
FRANK BERRY III, 25881
NELLIE GAIL RD, LA-
GUNA HILLS, CA 92653 &
S T E V E S C H I R A T I S ,
25881 NELLIE GAIL RD,
L A G U N A H I L L S , C A
92653. This business is
conducted by: GENERAL
PARTNERSHIP. Signa-
t u r e : M A R C F R A N Z .
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk of
Orange County on APRIL
02, 2024.

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141514

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246686256

COOL  KIDS  CUTS  BY
THAO  located at: 6887
K A T E L L A A V E ,
CYPRESS, CA 90630.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
trant/s/: PHUONG THAO
THI OLIVARRIA, 6887 KA-
TELLA AVE, CYPRESS,
CA 90630. Have you star-
ted doing business yet?
NO. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL.
Registrant /s/ PHUONG
THAO OLIVARRIA. I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 03/25/2024.

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141516

SUMMONS
(CITACION JUDICIAL)

CASE NUMBER
(Numero del Caso)

30-2024-01375280-CU-
PA-WJC

NOTICE TO
DEFENDANT:

(Aviso al Demandado):
GAVIN LEE DYKEMA;

DOES 1 to 10
YOU ARE BEING SUED

BY PLAINTIFF:
(Lo esta demandando el

demandante)
PAUL HOANG

NOTICE! You have been
sued. The court may de-
cide against you without
your being heard unless
you respond within 30
days. Read the informa-
tion below.
You have 30 calendar
days after this summons
and legal papers are
served on you to file a writ-
ten response at this court
and have a copy served
on the plaintiff. A letter or
phone call will not protect
you. Your wr i t ten re-
sponse must be in proper
legal form if you want the
court to hear your case.
There may be a court form
that you can use for your
response. You can find
these court forms and
more information at the
California Courts Online
Self-Help Center (www.
courtinfo.ca.gov/ selfhelp),
your county law library, or
the courthouse nearest
you. If you cannot pay the
filing fee, ask the court
clerk for a fee waiver form.
If you do not file your re-
sponse on time, you may
lose the case by default,
and your wages, money,
and property may be taken
without further warning
from the court.
There are other legal re-
quirements. You may want
to call an attorney right
away. If you do not know
an attorney, you may want
to call an attorney referral
service. If you cannot af-
ford an attorney, you may
be eligible for free legal
services from a nonprofit
legal services program.
You can locate these non-
profit groups at the Califor-
nia Legal Services Web
site (www.lawhelpcalifor-
nia.org), the California
Courts Online Self-Help
Center (www.courtinfo.ca.
gov/selfhelp), or by con-
tacting your local court of
county bar association.
NOTE: The court has a
statutory lien for waived
fees and costs on any set-
t lement or arb i t ra t ion
award of $10,000.00 or
more in a civil case. The
court's lien must be paid
before the court will dis-
miss the case.
A V I S O ! L o h a n d e -
mandado. Si no responde
dentro de 30 dias, la corte
puede decidir en su con-
tra sin escuchar su ver-
sion. Lea la informacion a
continuacion.
Tiene 30 dias de calen-
dario despues de que le
entreguen esta citacion y
papeles lega les para
presentar una respuesta
por escrito en esta corte y
hacer que se entregue una
copia al demandante. Una
carta o una llamada tele-
fonica no lo protegen. Su
respuesta por escrito tiene
que estar en formato legal
correcto si desea que pro-
cesen su caso en la corte.
Es posible que haya un
formular lo que usted
pueda usar su repuesta.
Puede encontrar estos for-
mularios de la corte y mas
informacion en el Centro
de Ayunda de las Cortes
de California (www.su-
corte.ca.gov), en la bibli-
oteca de leyes de su
condado o en la corte que
le quede mas cerca. Si no
puede pagar la cuota de
presentacion, pida al sec-
retario de la corte que le
de un formularlo de exen-
cion de pago de cuotas. Si
no presenta su respuesta
a tiempo, puede perder el
caso por incumplimiento y
la corte le podra quitar su
sueldo, dinero y blenes sin
mas advertencia.
Hay otros requisitos le-
gales. Es recomendable
que llame a un abogado
inmediatamente. Si no
conoce a un abogado,
puede llamar a un servicio
de remision a abogados.
Si no puede pagar a un
abogado, es posible que
cumpla con los requisitos
para obtener servicios le-
gales gratuitos de un pro-
grama de servicios le-
gales sin fines de lucro.
Puede encontrar estos
grupos sin fines de lucro
en el sitio web de Califor-
n i a L e g a l S e r v i c e s ,
(www.lawhelpcalifornia,org
), en el Centro de Ayunda
de las Cortes de Califor-
nia, (www.sucorte.ca.gov)
o poniendose en contacto
con la corte o el colegio de
abogados locales.
AVISO: Por ley, la corte
tiene derecho a reclamar
las cuotas y los costos ex-
entos por imponer un
gravamen sobre cualquier
r e c u p e r a c i o n d e
$10,000.00 o mas de val-
or recibida mediante un
acuerdo o una concesion
de arbitraje en un caso de
derecho civil. Tiene que
pagar el gravamen de la
corte antes de que la corte
pueda desechar el caso.
The name and address of
the court is (El nombre y
dirección de la corte es):
ORANGE COUNTY SU-
PERIOR COURT, WEST
JUSTICE CENTER, 8141
13TH STREET, WEST-
MINSTER, CA 92683
The name, address, and
te lephone number o f
plaint i f f ’s at torney, or
plaintiff without an attor-
n e y , i s ( E l n o m b r e ,
dirección y el número de
teléfono del abogado del
demandante, o del de-
mandante que no tiene
a b o g a d o , e s ) : V A N
NGHIEM, SBN: 175689,
INFLUENTIAL LAW, APC:
400 LIMESTONE WAY
#516, IRVINE, CA 92603;
(949) 231-2538
Date: 01/25/2024
David H. Yamasaki
Clerk of the Court, Clerk,
by (Secretario)
K. Climer
Deputy (Adjunto)
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON SERVED: You are
served
W e s t m i n s t e r H e r a l d
4/18,25,5/2,9/24 - 141517

Legals-WHJFICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246686980

GAINZ  BOX  located at:
7651 NANCY DRIVE,
HUNTINGTON BEACH,
CA 92647.  County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment. Registrant/s/: BRI-
AN ELLIS, 7651 NANCY
DRIVE, HUNTINGTON
BEACH, CA 92647. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by: IN-
DIVIDUAL. Registrant /s/
BRIAN ELLIS. I declare
that all information in this
statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information
which he or she knows to
be false is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk
of Orange County on
04/02/2024.

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141402

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687900

DEPENDABLE  COPIER
SERVICE  l oca ted a t :
18627 BROOKHURST ST.
#250, FOUNTAIN VAL-
LEY, CA 92708.  County:
Orange. This is a New
Statement. Registrant/s/:
MARK DONNELLY, 18627
BROOKHURST ST. #250,
FOUNTAIN VALLEY, CA
92708. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: INDIVIDUAL. Re-
gistrant /s/ MARK DON-
NELLY. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 1 5 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141488

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687786

UFC  GYM  GARDEN-
WALK located at: 400 W.
DISNEY WAY, STE #94,
ANAHEIM, CA 92802-
2915.  County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
R e g i s t r a n t / s / : A G W
HEALTH, LLC, 400 W.
DISNEY WAY, #94, ANA-
HEIM, CA 92802-2915.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
LIMITED LIABILITY COM-
PANY. Registrant /s/ TZU-
YIH YANG, CHIEF FINAN-
CIAL OFFICER. I declare
that all information in this
statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information
which he or she knows to
be false is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk
of Orange County on
04/11/2024.

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141507

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687550

CELEBRATION  located
a t : 1 9 0 1 N E W P O R T
BLVD, COSTA MESA, CA
92626.  County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
Registrant/s/: D.G.A.M.1,
LLC, 1901 NEWPORT
BLVD, COSTA MESA, CA
92626. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: LIMITED LIABIL-
ITY COMPANY. Regis-
t ran t / s / DOMENICO
GRILLO, MANAGING
MEMBER/MANAGER. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 0 9 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141509

Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687732

HEALTH  AND  BEAUTY
BOOST located at: 14550
MAGNOLIA ST SUITE
102, WESTMINSTER, CA
92683.  County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
Registrant/s/: XANTHIA
B A O T R A N , 1 4 5 5 0
MAGNOLIA ST SUITE
102, WESTMINSTER, CA
92683. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: INDIVIDUAL. Re-
g is t rant /s / XANTHIA
TRAN. I declare that all in-
formation in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 1 1 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141401

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246686980

GAINZ  BOX  located at:
7651 NANCY DRIVE,
HUNTINGTON BEACH,
CA 92647.  County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment. Registrant/s/: BRI-
AN ELLIS, 7651 NANCY
DRIVE, HUNTINGTON
BEACH, CA 92647. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by: IN-
DIVIDUAL. Registrant /s/
BRIAN ELLIS. I declare
that all information in this
statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information
which he or she knows to
be false is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk
of Orange County on
04/02/2024.

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141402

Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687199

BEAUTIFUL  NAILS  &
MORE located at: 13826
RED HILL AVE, TUSTIN,
CA 92780.  County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment. Registrant/s/: LAN
THI XUAN HOANG, 13826
RED HILL AVE, TUSTIN,
CA 92780. Have you star-
ted doing business yet?
NO. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL.
Registrant /s/ LAN HO-
ANG. I declare that all in-
formation in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 0 4 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141357

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687732

HEALTH  AND  BEAUTY
BOOST located at: 14550
MAGNOLIA ST SUITE
102, WESTMINSTER, CA
92683.  County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
Registrant/s/: XANTHIA
B A O T R A N , 1 4 5 5 0
MAGNOLIA ST SUITE
102, WESTMINSTER, CA
92683. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: INDIVIDUAL. Re-
g is t rant /s / XANTHIA
TRAN. I declare that all in-
formation in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 1 1 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141401

Legals-WHJ

STATEMENT OF
ABANDONMENT OF
USE OF FICTITIOUS

BUSINESS NAME
NO: 20246687159

BELLA'S  CLEANING
SERVICES,  located at
2622 W LINCOLN AVE
SUITE 203, ANAHEIM, CA
92801-6315. The Ficti-
tious Business name re-
ferred to above was filed in
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n :
07/25/2022, and assigned
File No. 20226640192 Is
(are) abandoned by the
fo l l ow ing reg is t ran ts :
M A R I B E L B R A C A -
MONTE, 2622 W LIN-
COLN AVE SUITE 203,
ANAHEIM, CA 92801-
6315. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. Signature: MARIBEL
BRACAMONTE. State-
ment filed with the Record-
er/County Clerk of Orange
County on APRIL 03,
2024.

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141334

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687199

BEAUTIFUL  NAILS  &
MORE located at: 13826
RED HILL AVE, TUSTIN,
CA 92780.  County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment. Registrant/s/: LAN
THI XUAN HOANG, 13826
RED HILL AVE, TUSTIN,
CA 92780. Have you star-
ted doing business yet?
NO. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL.
Registrant /s/ LAN HO-
ANG. I declare that all in-
formation in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 0 4 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141357

Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687438

SAINT CITY TATTOO loc-
ated at: 1155 W. CENT-
RAL AVE #208, SANTA
ANA, CA 92707.  County:
Orange. This is a New
Statement. Registrant/s/:
PAL TATTOO LLC, 1155
W CENTRAL AVE #208,
SANTA ANA, CA 92707.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
LIMITED LIABILITY COM-
PANY. Regis t ran t /s /
PETER LUNA, MAN-
AGING MEMBER/MAN-
AGER. I declare that all in-
formation in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 0 8 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141309

STATEMENT OF
ABANDONMENT OF
USE OF FICTITIOUS

BUSINESS NAME
NO: 20246687159

BELLA'S  CLEANING
SERVICES,  located at
2622 W LINCOLN AVE
SUITE 203, ANAHEIM, CA
92801-6315. The Ficti-
tious Business name re-
ferred to above was filed in
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n :
07/25/2022, and assigned
File No. 20226640192 Is
(are) abandoned by the
fo l l ow ing reg is t ran ts :
M A R I B E L B R A C A -
MONTE, 2622 W LIN-
COLN AVE SUITE 203,
ANAHEIM, CA 92801-
6315. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. Signature: MARIBEL
BRACAMONTE. State-
ment filed with the Record-
er/County Clerk of Orange
County on APRIL 03,
2024.

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141334

Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687438

SAINT CITY TATTOO loc-
ated at: 1155 W. CENT-
RAL AVE #208, SANTA
ANA, CA 92707.  County:
Orange. This is a New
Statement. Registrant/s/:
PAL TATTOO LLC, 1155
W CENTRAL AVE #208,
SANTA ANA, CA 92707.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
LIMITED LIABILITY COM-
PANY. Regis t ran t /s /
PETER LUNA, MAN-
AGING MEMBER/MAN-
AGER. I declare that all in-
formation in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 0 8 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141309



Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688188

a)  RIA  MONEY  TRANS-
FER,  b) AFEX  MONEY
TRANSFER,  c) XE  USA
located at: 7000 VILLAGE
D R I V E , S U I T E 2 0 0 ,
BUENA PARK, CA 90621.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
t ran t /s / : DANDELION
PAYMENTS, INC, 7000
VILLAGE DR, SUITE 200,
BUENA PARK, CA 90621.
Have you started doing
b u s i n e s s y e t ? Y E S ,
11/12/1995. This business
is conducted by: COR-
PORATION. Registrant /s/
SHAWN FIELDER, CHIEF
EXECUTIVE OFFICER. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 1 7 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141596

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687833

NATIONAL  FAIL  SAFE
l oca ted a t : 6442 IN-
DUSTRY WAY, WEST-
MINSTER, CA 92683.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
trant/s/: CURT PUSKAS,
6442 INDUSTRY WAY,
W E S T M I N S T E R , C A
92683 and VANESSA
P U S K A S , 6 4 4 2 I N -
DUSTRY WAY, WEST-
MINSTER, CA 92683.
Have you started doing
b u s i n e s s y e t ? Y E S ,
03/26/2024. This business
is conducted by: GENER-
AL PARTNERSHIP. Re-
g i s t r a n t / s / C U R T
PUSKAS, PARTNER. I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 04/12/2024.

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141603

File No. 20246687901
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS

NAME STATEMENT
The following person(s) is
(are) doing business as:
F i c t i t i o u s B u s i n e s s
Name(s): MASTERFUL
MEALS
Street Address, City &
State of Principal place of
Business: 16931 Coral
Cay Lane Hunt ington
Beach CA 92649, County:
Orange County
Full name of Registered
O w n e r : N A T H A N J .
SWUN 16931 Coral Cay
Lane Huntington Beach
CA 92649
Have you started doing
b u s i n e s s y e t ? Y e s :
0 2 / 0 1 / 2 0 2 4
This business is conduc-
ted by: an individual
I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
any material matter pursu-
ant to Section 17913 of the
Business and Professions
Code that the registrant
knows to be false is guilty
of a misdemeanor punish-
able by a fine not to ex-
ceed one thousand dol-
lars ($1,000).
Registrant(s) Name: Nath-
an Swun
Print Name and Title of Of-
ficer / Manager or General
Partner: NATHAN SWUN
Registrant(s) Signature:
Nathan Swun
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk-Re-
corder of
Orange County on April
15, 2024.
NOTICE - In accordance
with subdivision (a) of Sec-
tion 17920, a Fictitious
Name Statement gener-
ally expires at the end of
five years from the date on
which it was filed in the Of-
fice of the County Clerk.
Except, as provided in
subdivision (b) of Section
17920, where it expires 40
days after any change in
the facts set forth in the
statement pursuant to
Section 17913 other than
a change in the residence
address of a registered
owner. A New Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed before
the expiration.
The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of
another under Federal,
State, or Common Law
(See Section 14411 et
seq., Business and Profes-
sions Code).
Recorded in Official Re-
cords, Orange County
Hugh Nguyen, Clerk Re-
corder
New Statement
CN106165 Apr 25, May
2,9,16, 2024
Westminster  Journal
4 / 2 5 , 5 / 2 , 9 , 1 6 / 2 0 2 4 -
1 4 1 6 0 9

Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687476

a)  OOH  SHOOTER,  b)
CARGASMTV located at:
4770 EUREKA AVENUE
#23, YORBA LINDA, CA
92885.  County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
Reg is t ran t / s / : CHRIS
BUFORD, 4770 EUREKA
AVENUE #23, YORBA
LINDA, CA 92885. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by: IN-
DIVIDUAL. Registrant /s/
CHRIS BUFORD. I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 04/08/2024.

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141552

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246686523

DDD MARKETING SER-
VICES  located at: 7835
OLEANDER CIRCLE ,
BUENA PARK, CA 90620.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
t r a n t / s / : D A N I E L
CRESPO-GARCIA, 7835
OLEANDER CIRCLE ,
BUENA PARK, CA 90620.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. Registrant
/s/ DANIEL CRESPO-
GARCIA. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 3 / 2 7 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141591

STATEMENT OF
ABANDONMENT OF
USE OF FICTITIOUS

BUSINESS NAME
NO: 20246688187

a) RIA FINANCIAL SER-
VICES b) AFEX MONEY
EXPRESS  c) XE  USA,
located at 7000 VILLAGE
D R I V E , S U I T E 2 0 0 ,
BUENA PARK, CA 90621-
9062. The Fictitious Busi-
ness name referred to
above was filed in Orange
County on: 04/28/2022,
and assigned File No.
20226633417 Is (are)
abandoned by the follow-
ing registrants: CONTIN-
E N T A L E X C H A N G E
SOLUTIONS, INC., 7000
VILLAGE DRIVE, SUITE
200, BUENA PARK, CA
90621. This business is
conducted by: CORPORA-
TION. Signature: SHAWN
FIELDER, CHIEF EXEC-
UTIVE OFFICER. State-
ment filed with the Record-
er/County Clerk of Orange
County on APRIL 17,
2024.

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141594

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688188

a)  RIA  MONEY  TRANS-
FER,  b) AFEX  MONEY
TRANSFER,  c) XE  USA
located at: 7000 VILLAGE
D R I V E , S U I T E 2 0 0 ,
BUENA PARK, CA 90621.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
t ran t /s / : DANDELION
PAYMENTS, INC, 7000
VILLAGE DR, SUITE 200,
BUENA PARK, CA 90621.
Have you started doing
b u s i n e s s y e t ? Y E S ,
11/12/1995. This business
is conducted by: COR-
PORATION. Registrant /s/
SHAWN FIELDER, CHIEF
EXECUTIVE OFFICER. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 1 7 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141596

Legals-WHJ

SUMMONS
(CITACION JUDICIAL)

CASE NUMBER
(Numero del Caso)

30-2023-01317742-CL-
PA-CJC

NOTICE TO
DEFENDANT:

(Aviso al Demandado):
HUMBERTO BRYAN
SALAZAR OLVERA,
JOSE CRUZPRADO,

HUMBERTO SALAZAR
FLORES and DOES 1 to

20, inclusive.
YOU ARE BEING SUED

BY PLAINTIFF:
(Lo esta demandando el

demandante)
SEOK KO

NOTICE! You have been
sued. The court may de-
cide against you without
your being heard unless
you respond within 30
days. Read the informa-
tion below.
You have 30 calendar
days after this summons
and legal papers are
served on you to file a writ-
ten response at this court
and have a copy served
on the plaintiff. A letter or
phone call will not protect
you. Your wr i t ten re-
sponse must be in proper
legal form if you want the
court to hear your case.
There may be a court form
that you can use for your
response. You can find
these court forms and
more information at the
California Courts Online
Self-Help Center (www.
courtinfo.ca.gov/ selfhelp),
your county law library, or
the courthouse nearest
you. If you cannot pay the
filing fee, ask the court
clerk for a fee waiver form.
If you do not file your re-
sponse on time, you may
lose the case by default,
and your wages, money,
and property may be taken
without further warning
from the court.
There are other legal re-
quirements. You may want
to call an attorney right
away. If you do not know
an attorney, you may want
to call an attorney referral
service. If you cannot af-
ford an attorney, you may
be eligible for free legal
services from a nonprofit
legal services program.
You can locate these non-
profit groups at the Califor-
nia Legal Services Web
site (www.lawhelpcalifor-
nia.org), the California
Courts Online Self-Help
Center (www.courtinfo.ca.
gov/selfhelp), or by con-
tacting your local court of
county bar association.
NOTE: The court has a
statutory lien for waived
fees and costs on any set-
t lement or arb i t ra t ion
award of $10,000.00 or
more in a civil case. The
court's lien must be paid
before the court will dis-
miss the case.
A V I S O ! L o h a n d e -
mandado. Si no responde
dentro de 30 dias, la corte
puede decidir en su con-
tra sin escuchar su ver-
sion. Lea la informacion a
continuacion.
Tiene 30 dias de calen-
dario despues de que le
entreguen esta citacion y
papeles lega les para
presentar una respuesta
por escrito en esta corte y
hacer que se entregue una
copia al demandante. Una
carta o una llamada tele-
fonica no lo protegen. Su
respuesta por escrito tiene
que estar en formato legal
correcto si desea que pro-
cesen su caso en la corte.
Es posible que haya un
formular lo que usted
pueda usar su repuesta.
Puede encontrar estos for-
mularios de la corte y mas
informacion en el Centro
de Ayunda de las Cortes
de California (www.su-
corte.ca.gov), en la bibli-
oteca de leyes de su
condado o en la corte que
le quede mas cerca. Si no
puede pagar la cuota de
presentacion, pida al sec-
retario de la corte que le
de un formularlo de exen-
cion de pago de cuotas. Si
no presenta su respuesta
a tiempo, puede perder el
caso por incumplimiento y
la corte le podra quitar su
sueldo, dinero y blenes sin
mas advertencia.
Hay otros requisitos le-
gales. Es recomendable
que llame a un abogado
inmediatamente. Si no
conoce a un abogado,
puede llamar a un servicio
de remision a abogados.
Si no puede pagar a un
abogado, es posible que
cumpla con los requisitos
para obtener servicios le-
gales gratuitos de un pro-
grama de servicios le-
gales sin fines de lucro.
Puede encontrar estos
grupos sin fines de lucro
en el sitio web de Califor-
n i a L e g a l S e r v i c e s ,
(www.lawhelpcalifornia,org
), en el Centro de Ayunda
de las Cortes de Califor-
nia, (www.sucorte.ca.gov)
o poniendose en contacto
con la corte o el colegio de
abogados locales.
AVISO: Por ley, la corte
tiene derecho a reclamar
las cuotas y los costos ex-
entos por imponer un
gravamen sobre cualquier
r e c u p e r a c i o n d e
$10,000.00 o mas de val-
or recibida mediante un
acuerdo o una concesion
de arbitraje en un caso de
derecho civil. Tiene que
pagar el gravamen de la
corte antes de que la corte
pueda desechar el caso.
The name and address of
the court is (El nombre y
dirección de la corte es):
COUNTY OF ORANGE,
SUPERIOR COURT OF
CA, CENTRAL JUSTICE
CENTER, 700 CIV IC
CENTER DRIVE WEST,
SANTA ANA, CA 92701
The name, address, and
te lephone number o f
plaint i f f ’s at torney, or
plaintiff without an attor-
n e y , i s ( E l n o m b r e ,
dirección y el número de
teléfono del abogado del
demandante, o del de-
mandante que no tiene
abogado, es): HAI H. LAI;
(714) 593-5800; 9550
WARNER AVE. STE 250,
FOUNTAIN VALLEY, CA
92708
Date: 04/06/2023
David H. Yamasaki
Clerk of the Court,
Clerk, by (Secretario)
K. Climer
Deputy (Adjunto)
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON SERVED: You are
served
W e s t m i n s t e r J o u r n a l
4/18,25,5/2,9/24 - 141561

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687572

EVEN  OLIVES  CREAT-
IVE located at: 3400 AV-
ENUE OF THE ARTS,
U N I T C 1 2 2 , C O S T A
MESA, CA 92626. County:
Orange. This is a New
Statement. Registrant/s/:
A N N I E C A R O L I N E
GRUPP, 3400 AVENUE
OF THE ARTS, UNIT
C122, COSTA MESA, CA
9 2 6 2 6 & B R I T A N Y
NICOLE SAARE, 3400
AVENUE OF THE ARTS,
U N I T C 1 2 2 , C O S T A
MESA, CA 92626. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? YES, 3/10/2024.
This business is conduc-
ted by: GENERAL PART-
NERSHIP. Registrant /s/
A N N I E C A R O L I N E
GRUPP. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 0 9 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141343

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
30-2024-01377551

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Pet i t ioner:
NANCY THUY DAO filed a
petition with this court for a
decree changing name as
follows: NANCY THUY
DAO to THANH THUY THI
NGUYEN. The Court Or-
ders that all persons inter-
ested in this matter shall
appear before this court at
the hearing indicated be-
low to show cause, if any,
why the petition for change
of name should not be
granted. Any person ob-
j e c t i n g t o t h e n a me
changes described above
must file a written objec-
tion that includes the reas-
ons for the objection at
least two court days be-
fore the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and must
appear at the hearing to
show cause why the peti-
tion should not be granted.
If no written objection is
timely filed, the court may
grant the petition without a
hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING
06/04/2024

8:30 a.m. D100
REMOTE

Central Justice Center
700 Civic Center Drive

West
Santa Ana, CA 92701

(To appear remote ly ,
check in advance of the
hearing for information
about how to do so on the
court's website. To find
your court's website, go to
www.courts.ca.gov/find-
my-court.htm)
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be pub-
lished at least once each
week for four successive
weeks prior to the date set
for hearing on the petition
in the following newspa-
per of general circulation,
printed in this county:
Westminster Journal
DATE: 02/06/2024
JUDGE Layne Melzer
Judge of the
Superior Court

Westminster Herald
4/25,5/2,9,16/2024-

141562

Legals-WHJ

SUMMONS
(CITACION JUDICIAL)

CASE NUMBER
(Numero del Caso)

30-2023-01317742-CL-
PA-CJC

NOTICE TO
DEFENDANT:

(Aviso al Demandado):
HUMBERTO BRYAN
SALAZAR OLVERA,
JOSE CRUZPRADO,

HUMBERTO SALAZAR
FLORES and DOES 1 to

20, inclusive.
YOU ARE BEING SUED

BY PLAINTIFF:
(Lo esta demandando el

demandante)
SEOK KO

NOTICE! You have been
sued. The court may de-
cide against you without
your being heard unless
you respond within 30
days. Read the informa-
tion below.
You have 30 calendar
days after this summons
and legal papers are
served on you to file a writ-
ten response at this court
and have a copy served
on the plaintiff. A letter or
phone call will not protect
you. Your wr i t ten re-
sponse must be in proper
legal form if you want the
court to hear your case.
There may be a court form
that you can use for your
response. You can find
these court forms and
more information at the
California Courts Online
Self-Help Center (www.
courtinfo.ca.gov/ selfhelp),
your county law library, or
the courthouse nearest
you. If you cannot pay the
filing fee, ask the court
clerk for a fee waiver form.
If you do not file your re-
sponse on time, you may
lose the case by default,
and your wages, money,
and property may be taken
without further warning
from the court.
There are other legal re-
quirements. You may want
to call an attorney right
away. If you do not know
an attorney, you may want
to call an attorney referral
service. If you cannot af-
ford an attorney, you may
be eligible for free legal
services from a nonprofit
legal services program.
You can locate these non-
profit groups at the Califor-
nia Legal Services Web
site (www.lawhelpcalifor-
nia.org), the California
Courts Online Self-Help
Center (www.courtinfo.ca.
gov/selfhelp), or by con-
tacting your local court of
county bar association.
NOTE: The court has a
statutory lien for waived
fees and costs on any set-
t lement or arb i t ra t ion
award of $10,000.00 or
more in a civil case. The
court's lien must be paid
before the court will dis-
miss the case.
A V I S O ! L o h a n d e -
mandado. Si no responde
dentro de 30 dias, la corte
puede decidir en su con-
tra sin escuchar su ver-
sion. Lea la informacion a
continuacion.
Tiene 30 dias de calen-
dario despues de que le
entreguen esta citacion y
papeles lega les para
presentar una respuesta
por escrito en esta corte y
hacer que se entregue una
copia al demandante. Una
carta o una llamada tele-
fonica no lo protegen. Su
respuesta por escrito tiene
que estar en formato legal
correcto si desea que pro-
cesen su caso en la corte.
Es posible que haya un
formular lo que usted
pueda usar su repuesta.
Puede encontrar estos for-
mularios de la corte y mas
informacion en el Centro
de Ayunda de las Cortes
de California (www.su-
corte.ca.gov), en la bibli-
oteca de leyes de su
condado o en la corte que
le quede mas cerca. Si no
puede pagar la cuota de
presentacion, pida al sec-
retario de la corte que le
de un formularlo de exen-
cion de pago de cuotas. Si
no presenta su respuesta
a tiempo, puede perder el
caso por incumplimiento y
la corte le podra quitar su
sueldo, dinero y blenes sin
mas advertencia.
Hay otros requisitos le-
gales. Es recomendable
que llame a un abogado
inmediatamente. Si no
conoce a un abogado,
puede llamar a un servicio
de remision a abogados.
Si no puede pagar a un
abogado, es posible que
cumpla con los requisitos
para obtener servicios le-
gales gratuitos de un pro-
grama de servicios le-
gales sin fines de lucro.
Puede encontrar estos
grupos sin fines de lucro
en el sitio web de Califor-
n i a L e g a l S e r v i c e s ,
(www.lawhelpcalifornia,org
), en el Centro de Ayunda
de las Cortes de Califor-
nia, (www.sucorte.ca.gov)
o poniendose en contacto
con la corte o el colegio de
abogados locales.
AVISO: Por ley, la corte
tiene derecho a reclamar
las cuotas y los costos ex-
entos por imponer un
gravamen sobre cualquier
r e c u p e r a c i o n d e
$10,000.00 o mas de val-
or recibida mediante un
acuerdo o una concesion
de arbitraje en un caso de
derecho civil. Tiene que
pagar el gravamen de la
corte antes de que la corte
pueda desechar el caso.
The name and address of
the court is (El nombre y
dirección de la corte es):
COUNTY OF ORANGE,
SUPERIOR COURT OF
CA, CENTRAL JUSTICE
CENTER, 700 CIV IC
CENTER DRIVE WEST,
SANTA ANA, CA 92701
The name, address, and
te lephone number o f
plaint i f f ’s at torney, or
plaintiff without an attor-
n e y , i s ( E l n o m b r e ,
dirección y el número de
teléfono del abogado del
demandante, o del de-
mandante que no tiene
abogado, es): HAI H. LAI;
(714) 593-5800; 9550
WARNER AVE. STE 250,
FOUNTAIN VALLEY, CA
92708
Date: 04/06/2023
David H. Yamasaki
Clerk of the Court,
Clerk, by (Secretario)
K. Climer
Deputy (Adjunto)
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON SERVED: You are
served
W e s t m i n s t e r J o u r n a l
4/18,25,5/2,9/24 - 141561

Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246686012

GLENN B HETZEL & AS-
SOCIATES  located at:
25909 PALA, SUITE 320,
MISSION VIEJO, CA
92691.  County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
Registrant/s/: RMW AC-
COUNTING, INC, 2899
G R A N D A V E N U E ,
COCONUT GROVE, FL
33133. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: CORPORATION.
Registrant /s/ STEVEN DE
LA FE, CHIEF FINAN-
CIAL OFFICER. I declare
that all information in this
statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information
which he or she knows to
be false is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk
of Orange County on
03/21/2024.

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141557

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688063

THE  BALAD  FALAFEL
located at: 716 N VALLEY
ST STE Q, ANAHEIM, CA
92801.  County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
R e g i s t r a n t / s / : I Y A D
MORRA, 716 N VALLEY
ST STE Q, ANAHEIM, CA
92801. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: INDIVIDUAL. Re-
gistrant /s/ IYAD MORRA.
I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 1 6 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141560

SUMMONS
(CITACION JUDICIAL)

CASE NUMBER
(Numero del Caso)

30-2023-01317742-CL-
PA-CJC

NOTICE TO
DEFENDANT:

(Aviso al Demandado):
HUMBERTO BRYAN
SALAZAR OLVERA,
JOSE CRUZPRADO,

HUMBERTO SALAZAR
FLORES and DOES 1 to

20, inclusive.
YOU ARE BEING SUED

BY PLAINTIFF:
(Lo esta demandando el

demandante)
SEOK KO

NOTICE! You have been
sued. The court may de-
cide against you without
your being heard unless
you respond within 30
days. Read the informa-
tion below.
You have 30 calendar
days after this summons
and legal papers are
served on you to file a writ-
ten response at this court
and have a copy served
on the plaintiff. A letter or
phone call will not protect
you. Your wr i t ten re-
sponse must be in proper
legal form if you want the
court to hear your case.
There may be a court form
that you can use for your
response. You can find
these court forms and
more information at the
California Courts Online
Self-Help Center (www.
courtinfo.ca.gov/ selfhelp),
your county law library, or
the courthouse nearest
you. If you cannot pay the
filing fee, ask the court
clerk for a fee waiver form.
If you do not file your re-
sponse on time, you may
lose the case by default,
and your wages, money,
and property may be taken
without further warning
from the court.
There are other legal re-
quirements. You may want
to call an attorney right
away. If you do not know
an attorney, you may want
to call an attorney referral
service. If you cannot af-
ford an attorney, you may
be eligible for free legal
services from a nonprofit
legal services program.
You can locate these non-
profit groups at the Califor-
nia Legal Services Web
site (www.lawhelpcalifor-
nia.org), the California
Courts Online Self-Help
Center (www.courtinfo.ca.
gov/selfhelp), or by con-
tacting your local court of
county bar association.
NOTE: The court has a
statutory lien for waived
fees and costs on any set-
t lement or arb i t ra t ion
award of $10,000.00 or
more in a civil case. The
court's lien must be paid
before the court will dis-
miss the case.
A V I S O ! L o h a n d e -
mandado. Si no responde
dentro de 30 dias, la corte
puede decidir en su con-
tra sin escuchar su ver-
sion. Lea la informacion a
continuacion.
Tiene 30 dias de calen-
dario despues de que le
entreguen esta citacion y
papeles lega les para
presentar una respuesta
por escrito en esta corte y
hacer que se entregue una
copia al demandante. Una
carta o una llamada tele-
fonica no lo protegen. Su
respuesta por escrito tiene
que estar en formato legal
correcto si desea que pro-
cesen su caso en la corte.
Es posible que haya un
formular lo que usted
pueda usar su repuesta.
Puede encontrar estos for-
mularios de la corte y mas
informacion en el Centro
de Ayunda de las Cortes
de California (www.su-
corte.ca.gov), en la bibli-
o teca de leyes de su
condado o en la corte que
le quede mas cerca. Si no
puede pagar la cuota de
presentacion, pida al sec-
retario de la corte que le
de un formularlo de exen-
cion de pago de cuotas. Si
no presenta su respuesta
a tiempo, puede perder el
caso por incumplimiento y
la corte le podra quitar su
sueldo, dinero y blenes sin
mas advertencia.
Hay otros requisitos le-
gales. Es recomendable
que llame a un abogado
inmediatamente. Si no
conoce a un abogado,
puede llamar a un servicio
de remision a abogados.
Si no puede pagar a un
abogado, es posible que
cumpla con los requisitos
para obtener servicios le-
gales gratuitos de un pro-
grama de servicios le-
gales sin fines de lucro.
Puede encontrar estos
grupos sin fines de lucro
en el sitio web de Califor-
n i a L e g a l S e r v i c e s ,
(www.lawhelpcalifornia,org
), en el Centro de Ayunda
de las Cortes de Califor-
nia, (www.sucorte.ca.gov)
o poniendose en contacto
con la corte o el colegio de
abogados locales.
AVISO: Por ley, la corte
tiene derecho a reclamar
las cuotas y los costos ex-
entos por imponer un
gravamen sobre cualquier
r e c u p e r a c i o n d e
$10,000.00 o mas de val-
or recibida mediante un
acuerdo o una concesion
de arbitraje en un caso de
derecho civil. Tiene que
pagar el gravamen de la
corte antes de que la corte
pueda desechar el caso.
The name and address of
the court is (El nombre y
dirección de la corte es):
COUNTY OF ORANGE,
SUPERIOR COURT OF
CA, CENTRAL JUSTICE
CENTER, 700 CIV IC
CENTER DRIVE WEST,
SANTA ANA, CA 92701
The name, address, and
te lephone number o f
plaint i f f ’s at torney, or
plaintiff without an attor-
n e y , i s ( E l n o m b r e ,
dirección y el número de
teléfono del abogado del
demandante, o del de-
mandante que no tiene
abogado, es): HAI H. LAI;
(714) 593-5800; 9550
WARNER AVE. STE 250,
FOUNTAIN VALLEY, CA
92708
Date: 04/06/2023
David H. Yamasaki
Clerk of the Court,
Clerk, by (Secretario)
K. Climer
Deputy (Adjunto)
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON SERVED: You are
served
W e s t m i n s t e r J o u r n a l
4/18,25,5/2,9/24 - 141561

Legals-WHJ

SUMMONS
(CITACION JUDICIAL)

CASE NUMBER
(Numero del Caso)

30-2024-01375280-CU-
PA-WJC

NOTICE TO
DEFENDANT:

(Aviso al Demandado):
GAVIN LEE DYKEMA;

DOES 1 to 10
YOU ARE BEING SUED

BY PLAINTIFF:
(Lo esta demandando el

demandante)
PAUL HOANG

NOTICE! You have been
sued. The court may de-
cide against you without
your being heard unless
you respond within 30
days. Read the informa-
tion below.
You have 30 calendar
days after this summons
and legal papers are
served on you to file a writ-
ten response at this court
and have a copy served
on the plaintiff. A letter or
phone call will not protect
you. Your wr i t ten re-
sponse must be in proper
legal form if you want the
court to hear your case.
There may be a court form
that you can use for your
response. You can find
these court forms and
more information at the
California Courts Online
Self-Help Center (www.
courtinfo.ca.gov/ selfhelp),
your county law library, or
the courthouse nearest
you. If you cannot pay the
filing fee, ask the court
clerk for a fee waiver form.
If you do not file your re-
sponse on time, you may
lose the case by default,
and your wages, money,
and property may be taken
without further warning
from the court.
There are other legal re-
quirements. You may want
to call an attorney right
away. If you do not know
an attorney, you may want
to call an attorney referral
service. If you cannot af-
ford an attorney, you may
be eligible for free legal
services from a nonprofit
legal services program.
You can locate these non-
profit groups at the Califor-
nia Legal Services Web
site (www.lawhelpcalifor-
nia.org), the California
Courts Online Self-Help
Center (www.courtinfo.ca.
gov/selfhelp), or by con-
tacting your local court of
county bar association.
NOTE: The court has a
statutory lien for waived
fees and costs on any set-
t lement or arb i t ra t ion
award of $10,000.00 or
more in a civil case. The
court's lien must be paid
before the court will dis-
miss the case.
A V I S O ! L o h a n d e -
mandado. Si no responde
dentro de 30 dias, la corte
puede decidir en su con-
tra sin escuchar su ver-
sion. Lea la informacion a
continuacion.
Tiene 30 dias de calen-
dario despues de que le
entreguen esta citacion y
papeles lega les para
presentar una respuesta
por escrito en esta corte y
hacer que se entregue una
copia al demandante. Una
carta o una llamada tele-
fonica no lo protegen. Su
respuesta por escrito tiene
que estar en formato legal
correcto si desea que pro-
cesen su caso en la corte.
Es posible que haya un
formular lo que usted
pueda usar su repuesta.
Puede encontrar estos for-
mularios de la corte y mas
informacion en el Centro
de Ayunda de las Cortes
de California (www.su-
corte.ca.gov), en la bibli-
oteca de leyes de su
condado o en la corte que
le quede mas cerca. Si no
puede pagar la cuota de
presentacion, pida al sec-
retario de la corte que le
de un formularlo de exen-
cion de pago de cuotas. Si
no presenta su respuesta
a tiempo, puede perder el
caso por incumplimiento y
la corte le podra quitar su
sueldo, dinero y blenes sin
mas advertencia.
Hay otros requisitos le-
gales. Es recomendable
que llame a un abogado
inmediatamente. Si no
conoce a un abogado,
puede llamar a un servicio
de remision a abogados.
Si no puede pagar a un
abogado, es posible que
cumpla con los requisitos
para obtener servicios le-
gales gratuitos de un pro-
grama de servicios le-
gales sin fines de lucro.
Puede encontrar estos
grupos sin fines de lucro
en el sitio web de Califor-
n i a L e g a l S e r v i c e s ,
(www.lawhelpcalifornia,org
), en el Centro de Ayunda
de las Cortes de Califor-
nia, (www.sucorte.ca.gov)
o poniendose en contacto
con la corte o el colegio de
abogados locales.
AVISO: Por ley, la corte
tiene derecho a reclamar
las cuotas y los costos ex-
entos por imponer un
gravamen sobre cualquier
r e c u p e r a c i o n d e
$10,000.00 o mas de val-
or recibida mediante un
acuerdo o una concesion
de arbitraje en un caso de
derecho civil. Tiene que
pagar el gravamen de la
corte antes de que la corte
pueda desechar el caso.
The name and address of
the court is (El nombre y
dirección de la corte es):
ORANGE COUNTY SU-
PERIOR COURT, WEST
JUSTICE CENTER, 8141
13TH STREET, WEST-
MINSTER, CA 92683
The name, address, and
te lephone number o f
plaint i f f ’s at torney, or
plaintiff without an attor-
n e y , i s ( E l n o m b r e ,
dirección y el número de
teléfono del abogado del
demandante, o del de-
mandante que no tiene
a b o g a d o , e s ) : V A N
NGHIEM, SBN: 175689,
INFLUENTIAL LAW, APC:
400 LIMESTONE WAY
#516, IRVINE, CA 92603;
(949) 231-2538
Date: 01/25/2024
David H. Yamasaki
Clerk of the Court, Clerk,
by (Secretario)
K. Climer
Deputy (Adjunto)
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON SERVED: You are
served
W e s t m i n s t e r H e r a l d
4/18,25,5/2,9/24 - 141517

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687188

P E D I A T R I C S  &
NEONATOLOGY MEDIC-
AL GROUP OF ORANGE
COUNTY,  INC  located
a t : 1 2 6 6 5 G A R D E N
GROVE BLVD, STE 713,
GARDEN GROVE, CA
92843.  County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
Registrant/s/: PEDIATRIC
& NEONATOLOGY MED-
I C A L G R O U P , I N C . ,
12665 GARDEN GROVE
BLVD, STE 713, GARDEN
GROVE, CA 92843. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by:
CORPORATION. Regis-
t r a n t / s / J A C O B
SWEIDAN, M.D., PRESID-
ENT. I declare that all in-
formation in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 0 4 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141520

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687968

a)  4SQUARE  CREDIT
REPAIR,  b)  4SQUARE
CONSULTANTS LLC loc-
ated at : 9642 SALIS-
BURY LN, CYPRESS, CA
90630.  County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
Registrant/s/: 4SQUARE
CONSULTANTS LLC,
1712 PIONEER AVE STE
500, CHEYENNE, WY
82001. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: LIMITED LIABIL-
ITY COMPANY. Regis-
trant /s/ ROBERT MUN-
LEY, MANAGING MEM-
BER/MANAGER. I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 04/15/2024.

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141554

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246685530

APPRAISAL  NETWORK
located at: 17902 SHORE-
HAM LANE, HUNTING-
TON BEACH, CA 92649.
County: Orange. This is a
Re f i l e . P rev ious No .
2 0 1 9 6 5 3 7 4 5 6
Registrant/s/: ALBERT
PETER BASYE JR, 17902
SHOREHAM LN, HUNT-
INGTON BEACH, CA
92649. Have you started
doing business yet? YES.
This business is conduc-
ted by: INDIVIDUAL. Re-
gistrant /s/ ALBERT P.
BASYE JR. I declare that
all information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 3 / 1 5 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/18,25,5/2,9/24-141555

Legals-WHJ

SUMMONS
(CITACION JUDICIAL)

CASE NUMBER
(Numero del Caso)

30-2024-01375280-CU-
PA-WJC

NOTICE TO
DEFENDANT:

(Aviso al Demandado):
GAVIN LEE DYKEMA;

DOES 1 to 10
YOU ARE BEING SUED

BY PLAINTIFF:
(Lo esta demandando el

demandante)
PAUL HOANG

NOTICE! You have been
sued. The court may de-
cide against you without
your being heard unless
you respond within 30
days. Read the informa-
tion below.
You have 30 calendar
days after this summons
and legal papers are
served on you to file a writ-
ten response at this court
and have a copy served
on the plaintiff. A letter or
phone call will not protect
you. Your wr i t ten re-
sponse must be in proper
legal form if you want the
court to hear your case.
There may be a court form
that you can use for your
response. You can find
these court forms and
more information at the
California Courts Online
Self-Help Center (www.
courtinfo.ca.gov/ selfhelp),
your county law library, or
the courthouse nearest
you. If you cannot pay the
filing fee, ask the court
clerk for a fee waiver form.
If you do not file your re-
sponse on time, you may
lose the case by default,
and your wages, money,
and property may be taken
without further warning
from the court.
There are other legal re-
quirements. You may want
to call an attorney right
away. If you do not know
an attorney, you may want
to call an attorney referral
service. If you cannot af-
ford an attorney, you may
be eligible for free legal
services from a nonprofit
legal services program.
You can locate these non-
profit groups at the Califor-
nia Legal Services Web
site (www.lawhelpcalifor-
nia.org), the California
Courts Online Self-Help
Center (www.courtinfo.ca.
gov/selfhelp), or by con-
tacting your local court of
county bar association.
NOTE: The court has a
statutory lien for waived
fees and costs on any set-
t lement or arb i t ra t ion
award of $10,000.00 or
more in a civil case. The
court's lien must be paid
before the court will dis-
miss the case.
A V I S O ! L o h a n d e -
mandado. Si no responde
dentro de 30 dias, la corte
puede decidir en su con-
tra sin escuchar su ver-
sion. Lea la informacion a
continuacion.
Tiene 30 dias de calen-
dario despues de que le
entreguen esta citacion y
papeles lega les para
presentar una respuesta
por escrito en esta corte y
hacer que se entregue una
copia al demandante. Una
carta o una llamada tele-
fonica no lo protegen. Su
respuesta por escrito tiene
que estar en formato legal
correcto si desea que pro-
cesen su caso en la corte.
Es posible que haya un
formular lo que usted
pueda usar su repuesta.
Puede encontrar estos for-
mularios de la corte y mas
informacion en el Centro
de Ayunda de las Cortes
de California (www.su-
corte.ca.gov), en la bibli-
oteca de leyes de su
condado o en la corte que
le quede mas cerca. Si no
puede pagar la cuota de
presentacion, pida al sec-
retario de la corte que le
de un formularlo de exen-
cion de pago de cuotas. Si
no presenta su respuesta
a tiempo, puede perder el
caso por incumplimiento y
la corte le podra quitar su
sueldo, dinero y blenes sin
mas advertencia.
Hay otros requisitos le-
gales. Es recomendable
que llame a un abogado
inmediatamente. Si no
conoce a un abogado,
puede llamar a un servicio
de remision a abogados.
Si no puede pagar a un
abogado, es posible que
cumpla con los requisitos
para obtener servicios le-
gales gratuitos de un pro-
grama de servicios le-
gales sin fines de lucro.
Puede encontrar estos
grupos sin fines de lucro
en el sitio web de Califor-
n i a L e g a l S e r v i c e s ,
(www.lawhelpcalifornia,org
), en el Centro de Ayunda
de las Cortes de Califor-
nia, (www.sucorte.ca.gov)
o poniendose en contacto
con la corte o el colegio de
abogados locales.
AVISO: Por ley, la corte
tiene derecho a reclamar
las cuotas y los costos ex-
entos por imponer un
gravamen sobre cualquier
r e c u p e r a c i o n d e
$10,000.00 o mas de val-
or recibida mediante un
acuerdo o una concesion
de arbitraje en un caso de
derecho civil. Tiene que
pagar el gravamen de la
corte antes de que la corte
pueda desechar el caso.
The name and address of
the court is (El nombre y
dirección de la corte es):
ORANGE COUNTY SU-
PERIOR COURT, WEST
JUSTICE CENTER, 8141
13TH STREET, WEST-
MINSTER, CA 92683
The name, address, and
te lephone number o f
plaint i f f ’s at torney, or
plaintiff without an attor-
n e y , i s ( E l n o m b r e ,
dirección y el número de
teléfono del abogado del
demandante, o del de-
mandante que no tiene
a b o g a d o , e s ) : V A N
NGHIEM, SBN: 175689,
INFLUENTIAL LAW, APC:
400 LIMESTONE WAY
#516, IRVINE, CA 92603;
(949) 231-2538
Date: 01/25/2024
David H. Yamasaki
Clerk of the Court, Clerk,
by (Secretario)
K. Climer
Deputy (Adjunto)
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON SERVED: You are
served
W e s t m i n s t e r H e r a l d
4/18,25,5/2,9/24 - 141517



Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688480

CALI  LAB  SUPPLIES
located at: 2800 KELLER
DR. UNIT 258, TUSTIN,
CA 92782. County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment, Registrant/s/: AN-
THONY REYES, 2800
KELLER DR, UNIT 258,
TUSTIN, CA 92782 &
MARIA EVANGELISTA-
REYES, 2800 KELLER
DR, UNIT 258, TUSTIN,
CA 92782. Have you star-
ted doing business yet?
NO. This business is con-
ducted by: MARRIED
COUPLE. Registrant/s/:
ANTHONY REYES, GEN-
ERAL PARTNER I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 04/22/2024.

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-142060

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688918

S I M J O  T H E R M O -
PLASTIC  SOLUTIONS
located at: 2973 HARBOR
BLVD, #885, COSTA
MESA, CA 92626. County:
Orange. This is a New
Statement, Registrant/s/:
JORGE SUAREZ, 2973,
HARBOR BLVD, #885,
COSTA MESA, CA 92626.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
I N D I V I D U A L .
Regis t rant /s / : JORGE
SUAREZ. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 2 6 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-142061

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687592

PEPES  FINEST  MEXIC-
AN FOOD located at: 105
N BEACH BLVD, ANA-
HEIM, CA 92801. County:
Orange. This is a New
Statement, Registrant/s/:
RUSSI FOOD GROUP
INC, 124 N FIRST AVE,
STE 100, ARCADIA, CA
91006. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: CORPORATION.
Reg is t ran t /s / : ELENA
ALONZO, SECRETARY. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 0 9 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-142062

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246689086

BIG  IDEA  MARKETING
located at: 22782 IS-
LAMARE LANE, LAKE
FOREST, CA 92630 .
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
trant/s/: CLINTON FOR-
REST SCHWALD, 22782
ISLAMARE LANE, LAKE
FOREST, CA 92630. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by: IN-
DIVIDUAL. Registrant/s/:
CLINTON SCHWALD. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 3 0 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-142079

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688981

A L T U R A  M E N T A L
HEALTH located at: 809
E M E R A L D B A Y , L A -
GUNA BEACH, CA 92651.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
t r a n t / s / : S O L A R A
HEALTH, INC, 809 EMER-
A L D B A Y , L A G U N A
BEACH, CA 92651. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by:
CORPORATION. Regis-
trant/s/: DERIK BRIAN,
CHIEF EXECUTIVE OF-
FICER . I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 2 9 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-142085

Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688789

ECOM  DISTRIBUTIONS
located at: 263 BARNES
RD, TUSTIN, CA 92782.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
trant/s/: LFK DISTRIBU-
TIONS LLC, 263 BARNES
R O A D , T U S T I N , C A
92782. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: LIMITED LIABIL-
ITY COMPANY. Regis-
trant/s/: LAYTH ASSADI,
CHIEF EXECUTIVE OF-
FICER. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 2 5 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-141952

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687881

ANGEL HOUSE CLEAN-
ING  located at: 25751 VIA
LOMAS UNIT 141, LA-
GUNA HILLS, CA 92653.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
trant/s/: JOSE MIGUEL
ANGEL COLOP REYES,
25751 VIA LOMAS UNIT
141, LAGUNA HILLS, CA
92653. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: INDIVIDUAL. Re-
gistrant/s/: JOSE MIGUEL
COLOP REYES. I declare
that all information in this
statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information
which he or she knows to
be false is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk
of Orange County on
04/12/2024.

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-141999

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246686464

APEX FINANCIAL CON-
SULTING   located at:
2632 RIVERSIDE DR,
COSTA MESA, CA 92627.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
trant/s/: SUPER MOTOR-
S P O R T S I N C , 3 5 4
FLOWER ST, COSTA
MESA, CA 92627. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by:
CORPORATION. Regis-
trant/s/: TODD ABBOUD,
CHIEF EXECUTIVE OF-
FICER. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 3 / 2 6 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-142000

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687436

I N T E G R A L  F E N C E
SOLUTIONS  located at:
518 S CENTRAL PARK
AVE WEST, ANAHEIM,
CA 92802. County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment, Registrant/s/: JAR-
OD JAY ZASTROW, 518
S CENTRAL PARK AVE
WEST, ANAHEIM, CA
92802. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: INDIVIDUAL. Re-
gistrant/s/: JAROD ZA-
STROW. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 0 8 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-142059

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688480

CALI  LAB  SUPPLIES
located at: 2800 KELLER
DR. UNIT 258, TUSTIN,
CA 92782. County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment, Registrant/s/: AN-
THONY REYES, 2800
KELLER DR, UNIT 258,
TUSTIN, CA 92782 &
MARIA EVANGELISTA-
REYES, 2800 KELLER
DR, UNIT 258, TUSTIN,
CA 92782. Have you star-
ted doing business yet?
NO. This business is con-
ducted by: MARRIED
COUPLE. Registrant/s/:
ANTHONY REYES, GEN-
ERAL PARTNER I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 04/22/2024.

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-142060

Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688585

N  ZONE  SPORTS  MN
located at: 20141 INTERI-
OR LN, HUNTINGTON
B E A C H , C A 9 2 6 4 6 .
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
trant/s/: TOWER 33 ME-
DIA, LLC, 20141 INTERI-
OR LN, HUNTINGTON
BEACH, CA 92646. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by: LIM-
ITED LIABILITY COM-
PANY. Registrant /s/ BRI-
AN ALPER, MANAGING
MEMBER/MANAGER. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 2 3 / 2 0 2 4

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-141928

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687697

AJI  LIMON   located at:
7035 L INCOLN AVE,
BUENA PARK, CA 90620.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
trant/s/: EL SALI INC.,
7035 L INCOLN AVE,
BUENA PARK, CA 90620.
Have you started doing
b u s i n e s s y e t ? Y E S ,
10/31/2014. This business
is conducted by: COR-
PORATION. Registrant/s/:
FERNANDO PAZ, CHIEF
EXECUTIVE OFFICER. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 1 0 / 2 0 2 4

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-141930

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688724

#1  EXPRESS  CLEAN-
ERS   located at: 11103
B R O O K H U R S T S T ,
GARDEN GROVE, CA
92840. County: Orange.
This is a New Statement,
Registrant/s/: YING YANG
HOLDINGS, INC, 960 N.
TUSTIN ST, STE 266,
ORANGE, CA 92867.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. Regis-
trant/s/: LE TUAN, SEC-
RETARY. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 2 4 / 2 0 2 4

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-141950

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688662

JUNE PILATES  located
at: 2009 W COMMON-
WEALTH AVE SUITE F,
FULLERTON, CA 92833.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
trant/s/: PAUL IN, 2009 W
COMMONWEALTH AVE
SUITE F, FULLERTON,
CA 92833 & JUNE LEE,
2 0 0 9 W C O M M O N -
WEALTH AVE SUITE F,
FULLERTON, CA 92833.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
MARRIED COUPLE. Re-
gistrant/s/: PAUL IN. I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 04/24/2024

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-141951

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688789

ECOM  DISTRIBUTIONS
located at: 263 BARNES
RD, TUSTIN, CA 92782.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
trant/s/: LFK DISTRIBU-
TIONS LLC, 263 BARNES
R O A D , T U S T I N , C A
92782. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: LIMITED LIABIL-
ITY COMPANY. Regis-
trant/s/: LAYTH ASSADI,
CHIEF EXECUTIVE OF-
FICER. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 2 5 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-141952

Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687185

a)  SAPPHIRE  NOBLE
BOOKS,  b )  CHANGE
CAN  CREATE  JUSTICE
located at: 1674 N BRIG-
ANTINE LANE, ORANGE,
CA 92867.  County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment , Reg is t ran t / s / :
CHARITY M HARRIS,
1674 N BRIGANTINE
LANE, ORANGE, CA
92867. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: INDIVIDUAL. Re-
gistrant /s/ CHARITY M.
HARRIS. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 0 4 / 2 0 2 4

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141861

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687756

CAPE  CATALINA   loc-
ated at: 6501 PARK ROY-
AL CIR, HUNTINGTON
BEACH, CA 92648-6638.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
t r a n t / s / : R O B E R T
MOORE, 6501 PARK
ROYAL CIR, HUNTING-
TON BEACH, CA 92648 &
MARNIE MOORE, 6501
P A R K R O Y A L C I R ,
HUNTINGTON BEACH,
CA 92648. Have you star-
ted doing business yet?
YES, 09/01/2021. This
business is conducted by:
MARRIED COUPLE. Re-
g is t ran t / s / ROBERT
MOORE, OWNER. I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 04/11/2024.

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141864

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688572

POSTMARK  PLUS   loc-
ated at: 5434 LA PALMA
AVE, LA PALMA, CA
90623.  County: Orange.
This is a New Statement,
Reg is t ran t / s / : POST-
MARK PLUS LLC, 5434
LA PALMA AVE, LA
PALMA, CA 90623. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by: LIM-
ITED LIABILITY COM-
PANY. Registrant /s/ LEZ-
LIE MANUKIAN, CHIEF
EXECUTIVE OFFICER. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 2 3 / 2 0 2 4

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141865

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688585

N  ZONE  SPORTS  MN
located at: 20141 INTERI-
OR LN, HUNTINGTON
B E A C H , C A 9 2 6 4 6 .
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
trant/s/: TOWER 33 ME-
DIA, LLC, 20141 INTERI-
OR LN, HUNTINGTON
BEACH, CA 92646. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by: LIM-
ITED LIABILITY COM-
PANY. Registrant /s/ BRI-
AN ALPER, MANAGING
MEMBER/MANAGER. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 2 3 / 2 0 2 4

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-141928

Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246685799

C  AND  J'S  DISPATCH-
ING  located at: 5564 E
EDGEMAR AVE, ANA-
HEIM, CA 92807. County:
Orange. This is a New
Statement. Registrant/s/:
CATHERINE MARIE MA-
T I A S E V I C H , 5 5 6 4 E
EDGEMAR AVE, ANA-
HEIM, CA 92807. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by: IN-
DIVIDUAL. Registrant /s/
C A T H E R I N E M A T I A -
SEVICH. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 3 / 1 9 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141730

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687710

MONTESSORI  LEARN-
ING CENTER located at:
331 N. HARBOR BLVD,
ANAHEIM, CA 92805.
County: Orange. This is a
New Change. Previous
No. 20196542613 Regis-
t r a n t / s / : A S C E N D
ACADEMY INC, 8856
GRANT CIRCLE, BUENA
PARK, CA 90620. Have
you started doing busi-
n e s s y e t ? Y E S ,
06/20/2014. This business
is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. Registrant /s/
C H A M P I K A R A N A S -
INGHE, SECRETARY. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 1 0 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141821

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688447

KRUNCHY  DOG  located
at: 2162 BREA MALL,
BREA, CA 92821. County:
Orange. This is a Change,
P r e v i o u s N o .
2 0 2 3 6 6 7 7 8 4 7
Registrant/s/ : JINGBO
WANG, 24425 EASTG-
ATE DRIVE, DIAMOND
BAR, CA 91765 and
ROYSIUS PEI WEI LIM,
2162 BREA MALL, BREA,
ca 92821. Have you star-
ted doing business yet?
NO. This business is con-
ducted by: GENERAL
PARTNERSHIP. Regis-
trant /s/ JINGBO WANG. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 2 2 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141829

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688369

TERIYAKI  EPRESS  LA
HABRA located at: 1945
W LA HABRA BLVD, LA
H A B R A , C A 9 0 6 3 1 .
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
trant/s/ : 3H F&B LLC,
1945 W LA HABRA BLVD,
LA HABRA, CA 90631.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
LIMITED LIABILITY COM-
PANY. Registrant /s/
DAVID HONG, CHIEF EX-
ECUTIVE OFFICER. I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 04/22/2024.

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141830

Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246686444

G L O B A L  I M P L A N T
DENTISTRY  located at:
3053 EDINGER, TUSTIN,
CA 92780.  County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment. Registrant/s/: VINIT
JOSHI DDS, INC, 3053
EDINGER, TUSTIN, CA
92780. Have you started
doing business yet? YES,
01/01/2019. This business
is conducted by: COR-
PORATION. Registrant /s/
ANGELI KAPOOR, CHIEF
FINANCIAL OFFICER. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 3 / 2 6 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141633

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688072

FD  GARAGE  located at:
1207 E FLOWER ST UNIT
B, ANAHEIM, CA 92805.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
trant/s/: FRANK DE LOS
S A N T O S , 1 2 0 7 E
FLOWER ST UNIT B,
ANAHEIM, CA 92805.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. Registrant
/s/ FRANK DE LOS SAN-
TOS. I declare that all in-
formation in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 1 6 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141708

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688009

ASH  STREET  CIGAR
CLUB  located at: 11570
MALDEN ST, CYPRESS,
CA 90630.  County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment. Registrant/s/: DUJA,
INC, 11570 MALDEN ST,
CYPRESS, CA 90630.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. Regis-
trant /s/ JASON J LEE,
CHIEF EXECUTIVE OF-
FICER. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 1 6 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141710

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687222

ASALANDSTYLE located
at : 3800 BARRANCA
PKWY, UNIT C, STE 15,
I R V I N E , C A 9 2 6 0 6 .
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
t r an t / s / : ASAL SAR -
RAFINEZHAD, 3800 BAR-
RANCA PKWY, UNIT C,
STE 15, IRVINE, CA
92606. Have you started
doing business yet? YES,
01/10/1984. This business
is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. Registrant /s/
ASAL SARRAFINEZHAD.
I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 0 4 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141725

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246685799

C  AND  J'S  DISPATCH-
ING  located at: 5564 E
EDGEMAR AVE, ANA-
HEIM, CA 92807. County:
Orange. This is a New
Statement. Registrant/s/:
CATHERINE MARIE MA-
T I A S E V I C H , 5 5 6 4 E
EDGEMAR AVE, ANA-
HEIM, CA 92807. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by: IN-
DIVIDUAL. Registrant /s/
C A T H E R I N E M A T I A -
SEVICH. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 3 / 1 9 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141730

Legals-WHJ

File No. 20246687901
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS

NAME STATEMENT
The following person(s) is
(are) doing business as:
F i c t i t i o u s B u s i n e s s
Name(s): MASTERFUL
MEALS
Street Address, City &
State of Principal place of
Business: 16931 Coral
Cay Lane Hunt ington
Beach CA 92649, County:
Orange County
Full name of Registered
O w n e r : N A T H A N J .
SWUN 16931 Coral Cay
Lane Huntington Beach
CA 92649
Have you started doing
b u s i n e s s y e t ? Y e s :
0 2 / 0 1 / 2 0 2 4
This business is conduc-
ted by: an individual
I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
any material matter pursu-
ant to Section 17913 of the
Business and Professions
Code that the registrant
knows to be false is guilty
of a misdemeanor punish-
able by a fine not to ex-
ceed one thousand dol-
lars ($1,000).
Registrant(s) Name: Nath-
an Swun
Print Name and Title of Of-
ficer / Manager or General
Partner: NATHAN SWUN
Registrant(s) Signature:
Nathan Swun
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk-Re-
corder of
Orange County on April
15, 2024.
NOTICE - In accordance
with subdivision (a) of Sec-
tion 17920, a Fictitious
Name Statement gener-
ally expires at the end of
five years from the date on
which it was filed in the Of-
fice of the County Clerk.
Except, as provided in
subdivision (b) of Section
17920, where it expires 40
days after any change in
the facts set forth in the
statement pursuant to
Section 17913 other than
a change in the residence
address of a registered
owner. A New Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed before
the expiration.
The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of
another under Federal,
State, or Common Law
(See Section 14411 et
seq., Business and Profes-
sions Code).
Recorded in Official Re-
cords, Orange County
Hugh Nguyen, Clerk Re-
corder
New Statement
CN106165 Apr 25, May
2,9,16, 2024
Westminster  Journal
4 / 2 5 , 5 / 2 , 9 , 1 6 / 2 0 2 4 -
1 4 1 6 0 9

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687645

TERIYAKI  EXPREESS
located at: 1945 W LA
H A B R A B L V D , L A
H A B R A , C A 9 0 6 3 1 .
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
trant/s/ : 3H F&B LLC,
1945 W LA HABRA BLVD,
LA HABRA, CA 90631.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
LIMITED LIABILITY COM-
PANY. Registrant /s/ DAV-
ID HONG, CHIEF EXEC-
UTIVE OFFICER. I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 04/10/2024.

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141621

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688200

a)  LAW  OFFICES  OF
M A R G A R E T  A
CHIDESTER  &  ASSO-
CIATES  b) LAW  OF-
FICES OF MARGARET A
CHIDESTER  located at:
2 1 5 1 M I C H E L S O N
DRIVE, STE 260, IRVINE,
CA 92612.  County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment. Registrant/s/: MAR-
GARET A CHIDESTER A
P R O F C O R P , 2 1 5 1
MICHELSON DRIVE, STE
260, IRVINE, CA 92612.
Have you started doing
b u s i n e s s y e t ? Y E S ,
09/01/2000. This business
is conducted by: COR-
PORATION. Registrant /s/
M A R G A R E T A
CHIDESTER, PRESID-
ENT. I declare that all in-
formation in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 1 7 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141625

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687704

RC  HANGAR  located at:
180 HARVARD LN, SEAL
B E A C H , C A 9 0 7 4 0 .
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
t r a n t / s / : O C T A V I O
SARACCO, 180 HAR-
VARD LN, SEAL BEACH,
CA 90740. Have you star-
ted doing business yet?
NO. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL.
Registrant /s/ OCTAVIO
SARACCO. I declare that
all information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 1 0 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141630

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246686444

G L O B A L  I M P L A N T
DENTISTRY  located at:
3053 EDINGER, TUSTIN,
CA 92780.  County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment. Registrant/s/: VINIT
JOSHI DDS, INC, 3053
EDINGER, TUSTIN, CA
92780. Have you started
doing business yet? YES,
01/01/2019. This business
is conducted by: COR-
PORATION. Registrant /s/
ANGELI KAPOOR, CHIEF
FINANCIAL OFFICER. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 3 / 2 6 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/24-141633



Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687202

PARSEH  INNOVATORS
located at: 15540 ROCK-
FILD BLVD, IRVINE, CA
92618. County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
Regis t rant /s / : BABAK
SAFVAT, 15540 ROCK-
FILD BLVD, IRVINE, CA
92618 & ARASH MAD-
DAH, 15440 ROCKFILD
BLVD, IRVINE, CA 92618.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
GENERAL PARTNER-
SHIP. Reg is t ran t /s / :
BABAK SAFVAT. I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 04/04/2024.

Westminster Journal
5/9,16,23,30/24-142271

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246689656

PROPHECY TECHNOLO-
GIES  located at: 7545
IRVINE CENTER DRIVE
STE 200, IRVINE, CA
92618. County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
Registrant/s/: PROPH-
ECY CONSULTING INC,
7545 IRVINE CENTER
DRIVE STE 200, IRVINE,
CA 92618. Have you star-
ted doing business yet?
YES, 05/01/2024. This
business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. Regis-
trant/s/: SENTHIL MAR-
IMUTHU, CHIEF EXEC-
UTIVE OFFICER. I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 05/07/2024.

Westminster Journal
5/9,16,23,30/24-142273

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688503

O R A N G E  C O U N T Y
CREAMERY  located at:
34255 PACIFIC COAST
HIGHWAY, DANA POINT,
CA 92629. County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment. Registrant/s/: IGS
GROUP, LLC, 34255 PA-
CIFIC COAST HIGHWAY,
DANA POINT, CA 92629.
Have you started doing
b u s i n e s s y e t ? Y E S ,
06/28/2023. This business
is conducted by: LIMITED
LIABILITY COMPANY.
R e g i s t r a n t / s / : S U N E
STEFANI, CHIEF EXEC-
UTIVE OFFICER. I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 04/22/2024.

Westminster Journal
5/9,16,23,30/24-142275

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246689236

WICKLOW  FIELDS  loc-
ated at: 5267 WARNER
AVE, #339, HUNTING-
TON BEACH, CA 92649.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
t r a n t / s / : P A T R I C I A
KNIGHT, 16161 PARK-
SIDE LN, #56, HUNTING-
TON BEACH, CA 92649.
Have you started doing
b u s i n e s s y e t ? Y E S ,
01/31/2023. This business
is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. Registrant/s/:
PATRICIA KNIGHT. I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 05/01/2024.

Westminster Journal
5/9,16,23,30/24-142277

Legals-WHJFICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246689425

VINTAGE  VOGUE  loc-
ated at: 2050 W WHITTI-
ER BLVD SUITE H, LA
H A B R A , C A 9 0 6 3 1 .
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
trant/s/: COURTNEY DE-
FER, 2050 W WHITTIER
B L V D S U I T E H , L A
HABRA, CA 90631. Have
you started doing busi-
n e s s y e t ? Y E S
03/01/2008. This business
is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. Registrant/s/:
COURTNEY DEFER. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 5 / 0 3 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/9,16,23,30/24-142231

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
OF BULK SALE

(UCC 6105)
Escrow No. BU-3482-SR

Notice is hereby given that
a bulk sale is about to be
made. The name and busi-
ness address of the Seller
is:
(1) The name of the Seller:
EMBASSY CONSULTING
SERVICES, LLC, A CALI-
FORNIA LIMITED LIABIL-
ITY COMPANY
(2) Name of the Business
being sold: EMBASSY
CONSULTING SERVICES
(3) Business address(es)
of the Seller(s) is: 11278
L O S A L A M I T O S
BOULEVARD, #232, LOS
ALAMITOS, CA 90720
(4) The location in Califor-
nia of the chief executive
office of the Seller is: 4221
A V E N I D A M A D R I D ,
CYPRESS, CA 90630
(5) Al l other business
names and addresses
used by the Seller within
the past (3) years, as
stated by the Seller is:
NONE
(6) The name of the Buyer
is: IRIDESSA CAPITAL
LLC, A WYOMING LIM-
ITED LIABILITY COM-
PANY (7) The address of
the Buyer is: 2101 174TH
STREET NORTHEAST,
KK105, MARYSVILLE,
WA 98271
(8) General description of
the assets of EMBASSY
C O N S U L T I N G S E R -
VICES to be sold is de-
scribed as: FURNITURE,
FIXTURE, AND EQUIP-
MENT located at: 11278
L O S A L A M I T O S
BOULEVARD, #232, LOS
ALAMITOS, CA 90720
(9) The Bulk Sale is inten-
ded to be consummated at
the office of: SECURED
TRUST ESCROW, INC.,
C/O BELL SANTIAGO,
E S C R O W O F F I C E R ,
21111 VICTOR ST, TOR-
RANCE, CA 90503, TEL:
(310) 318-3300; EMAIL:
I N F O @ S E -
CUREDTRUSTESCROW.
COM; Escrow No. BU-
3482-SR
(10) The anticipated date
of the bulk sale is MAY 29,
2024
(11) The last day for filing
claims by any creditor
shall be MAY 28, 2024,
which is the business day
before the anticipated sale
date specified above.
(12) This Bulk Sale is not
subject to California Uni-
form Commercial Code
Section 6106.2.
DATE:
BUYER: IRIDESSA CAP-
ITAL LLC, A WYOMING
LIMITED LIABILITY COM-
PANY
ORD-2334934 WESTMIN-
STER JOURNAL 5/9/24
Westminster  Journal
5/9/2024-142251

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246687202

PARSEH  INNOVATORS
located at: 15540 ROCK-
FILD BLVD, IRVINE, CA
92618. County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
Regis t rant /s / : BABAK
SAFVAT, 15540 ROCK-
FILD BLVD, IRVINE, CA
92618 & ARASH MAD-
DAH, 15440 ROCKFILD
BLVD, IRVINE, CA 92618.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
GENERAL PARTNER-
SHIP. Reg is t ran t /s / :
BABAK SAFVAT. I de-
clare that all information in
this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who
declares as true informa-
t ion which he or she
knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the
County Clerk of Orange
County on 04/04/2024.

Westminster Journal
5/9,16,23,30/24-142271

Legals-WHJ

File No. 20246688246
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS

NAME STATEMENT
The following person(s) is
(are) doing business as:
F i c t i t i o u s B u s i n e s s
Name(s): MICA BY THE
SEA
Street Address, City &
State of Principal place of
Business: 154 S. Harbor
Blvd. Anaheim, CA 92805,
County: Orange County
Full name of Registered
Owner: MICA INTERNA-
TIONAL TRADING 154 S.
Harbor Blvd. Anaheim, CA
92805 CA
Have you started doing
b u s i n e s s y e t ? Y e s :
0 1 / 2 7 / 2 0 0 9
This business is conduc-
ted by: a corporation
I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
any material matter pursu-
ant to Section 17913 of the
Business and Professions
Code that the registrant
knows to be false is guilty
of a misdemeanor punish-
able by a fine not to ex-
ceed one thousand dol-
lars ($1,000).
Registrant(s) Name: MICA
INTERNATIONAL TRAD-
ING
Print Name and Title of Of-
ficer / Manager or General
P a r t n e r : D I A N A M
SINGCA, Chief Executive
Officer
Registrant(s) Signature:
Diana M Singca
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk-Re-
corder of
Orange County on April
17, 2024.
NOTICE - In accordance
with subdivision (a) of Sec-
tion 17920, a Fictitious
Name Statement gener-
ally expires at the end of
five years from the date on
which it was filed in the Of-
fice of the County Clerk.
Except, as provided in
subdivision (b) of Section
17920, where it expires 40
days after any change in
the facts set forth in the
statement pursuant to
Section 17913 other than
a change in the residence
address of a registered
owner. A New Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed before
the expiration.
The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of
another under Federal,
State, or Common Law
(See Section 14411 et
seq., Business and Profes-
sions Code).
Recorded in Official Re-
cords, Orange County
Hugh Nguyen, Clerk Re-
corder
Westminster  Journal
4 / 2 5 , 5 / 2 , 9 , 1 6 / 2 0 2 4 -
1 4 1 8 4 0

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246689419

PRADO  located at: 262
MYRTLE ST, LAGUNA
B E A C H , C A 9 2 6 5 1 .
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
t r a n t / s / : M A X W E L L
F R E E S E M A N N , 2 6 2
MYRTLE ST, LAGUNA
BEACH, CA 92651. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by: IN-
DIVIDUAL. Registrant/s/:
M A X W E L L F R E E S E -
MANN. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 5 / 0 3 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/9,16,23,30/24-142229

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246689425

VINTAGE  VOGUE  loc-
ated at: 2050 W WHITTI-
ER BLVD SUITE H, LA
H A B R A , C A 9 0 6 3 1 .
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
trant/s/: COURTNEY DE-
FER, 2050 W WHITTIER
B L V D S U I T E H , L A
HABRA, CA 90631. Have
you started doing busi-
n e s s y e t ? Y E S
03/01/2008. This business
is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. Registrant/s/:
COURTNEY DEFER. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 5 / 0 3 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/9,16,23,30/24-142231

Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246689112

G A M E D A Y  M E N ' S
HEALTH  FULLERTON
located at: 1440 N HAR-
BOR BLVD, SUITE 103,
FULLERTON, CA 92835.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
trant/s/: BERKEY GROUP
PC, 1440 N HARBOR
B L V D , S U I T E 1 0 3 ,
FULLERTON, CA 92835.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. This
business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. Regis-
trant/s/: ALLYSON BER-
KEY, M.D., PRESIDENT .
I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 3 0 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-142087

File No. 20246687896
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS

NAME STATEMENT
The following person(s) is
(are) doing business as:
F i c t i t i o u s B u s i n e s s
Name(s): LJ TRADING
SERVICE
Street Address, City &
State of Principal place of
Business: 18980 De Anda
Ln Yorba Linda CA 92886-
2600, County: Orange
County
Full name of Registered
Owner: R&E GROUP INC
CA
18980 De Anda Ln Yorba
Linda CA 92886-2600
Have you started doing
b u s i n e s s y e t ? Y e s :
0 1 / 2 4 / 2 0 2 2
This business is conduc-
ted by: a corporation
I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
any material matter pursu-
ant to Section 17913 of the
Business and Professions
Code that the registrant
knows to be false is guilty
of a misdemeanor punish-
able by a fine not to ex-
ceed one thousand dol-
lars ($1,000).
Registrant(s) Name: R&E
GROUP INC
Print Name and Title of Of-
ficer / Manager or General
Partner: GRACE YAOMEI
HAN, Chief Executive Of-
ficer
Registrant(s) Signature:
Grace Yaomei Han
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk-Re-
corder of
Orange County on April
12, 2024.
NOTICE - In accordance
with subdivision (a) of Sec-
tion 17920, a Fictitious
Name Statement gener-
ally expires at the end of
five years from the date on
which it was filed in the Of-
fice of the County Clerk.
Except, as provided in
subdivision (b) of Section
17920, where it expires 40
days after any change in
the facts set forth in the
statement pursuant to
Section 17913 other than
a change in the residence
address of a registered
owner. A New Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed before
the expiration.
The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of
another under Federal,
State, or Common Law
(See Section 14411 et
seq., Business and Profes-
sions Code).
Recorded in Official Re-
cords, Orange County
Hugh Nguyen, Clerk Re-
corder
New Statement
CN104615 Apr 25, May
2,9,16, 2024
Westminster  Journal
4 / 2 5 , 5 / 2 , 9 , 1 6 / 2 0 2 4 -
1 4 1 7 4 1

Legals-WHJ

NOTICE OF PETITION
TO ADMINISTER

ESTATE OF:
MARTHA JUDITH KLEIN

CASE NO.
30-2024-01397431-PR-

LA-CMC
To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors, contingent cred-
itors, and persons who
may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate,
or both, of MARTHA JU-
DITH KLEIN.
A PETITION FOR PRO-
BATE has been filed by
C A R L O S B O L A N O S
ZUNIGA in the Superior
Court of California, County
of Orange.
THE PETIT ION FOR
PROBATE request that
C A R L O S B O L A N O S
ZUNIGA be appointed as
personal representative to
administer the estate of
the decedent.
THE PETITION requests
authority to administer the
estate under the Inde-
pendent Administration of
Estates Act. (This author-
ity will allow the personal
representat ive to take
many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Be-
fore taking certain very im-
portant actions, however,
the personal representat-
ive will be required to give
notice to interested per-
sons unless they have
waived notice or consen-
ted to the p roposed
action.) The independent
administration authority
will be granted unless an
interested person files an
objection to the petition
and shows good cause
why the court should not
grant the authority.
A HEARING on the peti-
tion will be held on AUG
15,  2024  at  1:30  PM  in
Dept.  CM07  located  at
3390  HARBOR  BLVD,
C O S T A  M E S A ,  C A
9 2 6 2 6 .
The court is providing the
convenience to appear for
hearing by video using the
court’s designated video
platform. This is a no cost
service to the public. Go to
the Court’s website at The
Superior Court of Califor-
nia - County of Orange
(occourts.org) to appear
remotely for Probate hear-
ings and for remote hear-
ing instructions. If you
have difficulty connecting
or are unable to connect to
your remote hearing, call
657-622-8278 for assist-
ance. If you prefer to ap-
pear in-person, you can
appear in the department
on the day/time set for
your hearing.
IF YOU OBJECT to the
granting of the petition,
you should appear at the
hearing and state your ob-
jections or file written ob-
jections with the court be-
fore the hearing. Your ap-
pearance may be in per-
son or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDIT-
OR or a contingent credit-
or of the decedent, you
must file your claim with
the court and mail a copy
to the personal represent-
ative appointed by the
court the later of either (1)
four months from the date
of first issuance of letters
to a general personal rep-
resentative, as defined in
section 58(b) of the Cali-
fornia Probate Code, or (2)
60 days from the date of
mailing or personal deliv-
ery to you of a notice un-
der section 9052 of the
California Probate Code.
Other California statues
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a credit-
or. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney know-
ledgeable in California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the
file kept by the court. If you
are a person interested in
the estate, you may file
with the court a Request
for Special Notice (form
DE-154) of the filing of an
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any pe-
t i t i on o r accoun t a s
provided in Probate Code
section 1250. A Request
for Special Notice form is
available from the court
clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner:
TRENT C. MARCUS,
ESQ, TRENT C. MAR-
CUS, A LAW CORPORA-
TION
19900 BEACH BLVD, C-1,
HUNTINGTON BEACH,
CA 92648
BSC 225099
Westminster Journal
5 / 9 , 5 / 1 6 , 5 / 2 3 / 2 0 2 4 -
1 4 2 2 1 7

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
30-2024-01394100

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Pet i t ioner:
DUNG LE NGOC NGUY-
EN filed a petition with this
court for a decree chan-
ging name as fol lows:
DUNG LE NGOC NGUY-
EN to MINA NGUYEN.
The Court Orders that all
persons interested in this
matter shall appear before
this court at the hearing in-
dicated below to show
cause, if any, why the peti-
tion for change of name
should not be granted. Any
person objecting to the
name changes described
above must file a written
objection that includes the
reasons for the objection
at least two court days be-
fore the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and must
appear at the hearing to
show cause why the peti-
tion should not be granted.
If no written objection is
timely filed, the court may
grant the petition without a
hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING
07/09/2024

8:30 a.m. D100
REMOTE

Central Justice Center
700 Civic Center Drive

West
Santa Ana, CA 92701

(To appear remote ly ,
check in advance of the
hearing for information
about how to do so on the
court's website. To find
your court's website, go to
www.courts.ca.gov/find-
my-court.htm)
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be pub-
lished at least once each
week for four successive
weeks prior to the date set
for hearing on the petition
in the following newspa-
per of general circulation,
printed in this county:
Westminster Journal
DATE: 04/18/2024
JUDGE Layne Melzer
Judge of the
Superior Court

Westminster Journal
4/25,5/2,9,16/2024-

141717

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688780

MACARTHUR  JAMES
LLP located at: 3001 RED
HILL AVE, BLDG. 4
S U I T E 2 1 3 , C O S T A
MESA, CA 92626. County:
Orange. This is a New
Statement, Registrant/s/:
DOUGLAS MUEHLHAUS-
ER, 1854 PORT TAG-
GART PLACE, NEW-
PORT BEACH, CA 92660
& PAYSON LEMEILLEUR,
72 BRIDGEPORT ROAD,
NEWPORT COAST, CA
92657. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
This business is conduc-
ted by: LIMITED LIABIL-
ITY COMPANY. Regis-
trant/s/: DOUG MUEHL-
HAUSER. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 2 5 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/9,16,23,30/24-142139

Legals-WHJ

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246689260

LEI POP located at: 5815
E LA PALMA #128, ANA-
HEIM, CA 92807. County:
Orange. This is a New
Statement, Registrant/s/:
LEI MARKETING, 5815
LA PALMA #128, ANA-
HEIM, CA 92807. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by:
CORPORATION. Regis-
t rant /s/ : PAUL PHAM,
CHIEF EXECUTIVE OF-
FICER. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 5 / 0 1 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/9,16,23,30/24-142181

NOTICE OF PETITION
TO ADMINISTER

ESTATE OF:
MARTHA JUDITH KLEIN

CASE NO.
30-2024-01397431-PR-

LA-CMC
To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors, contingent cred-
itors, and persons who
may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate,
or both, of MARTHA JU-
DITH KLEIN.
A PETITION FOR PRO-
BATE has been filed by
C A R L O S B O L A N O S
ZUNIGA in the Superior
Court of California, County
of Orange.
THE PETIT ION FO R
PROBATE request that
C A R L O S B O L A N O S
ZUNIGA be appointed as
personal representative to
administer the estate of
the decedent.
THE PETITION requests
authority to administer the
estate under the Inde-
pendent Administration of
Estates Act. (This author-
ity will allow the personal
representat ive to take
many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Be-
fore taking certain very im-
portant actions, however,
the personal representat-
ive will be required to give
notice to interested per-
sons unless they have
waived notice or consen-
ted to the p roposed
action.) The independent
administration authority
will be granted unless an
interested person files an
objection to the petition
and shows good cause
why the court should not
grant the authority.
A HEARING on the peti-
tion will be held on AUG
15,  2024  at  1:30  PM  in
Dept.  CM07  located  at
3390  HARBOR  BLVD,
C O S T A  M E S A ,  C A
9 2 6 2 6 .
The court is providing the
convenience to appear for
hearing by video using the
court’s designated video
platform. This is a no cost
service to the public. Go to
the Court’s website at The
Superior Court of Califor-
nia - County of Orange
(occourts.org) to appear
remotely for Probate hear-
ings and for remote hear-
ing instructions. If you
have difficulty connecting
or are unable to connect to
your remote hearing, call
657-622-8278 for assist-
ance. If you prefer to ap-
pear in-person, you can
appear in the department
on the day/time set for
your hearing.
IF YOU OBJECT to the
granting of the petition,
you should appear at the
hearing and state your ob-
jections or file written ob-
jections with the court be-
fore the hearing. Your ap-
pearance may be in per-
son or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDIT-
OR or a contingent credit-
or of the decedent, you
must file your claim with
the court and mail a copy
to the personal represent-
ative appointed by the
court the later of either (1)
four months from the date
of first issuance of letters
to a general personal rep-
resentative, as defined in
section 58(b) of the Cali-
fornia Probate Code, or (2)
60 days from the date of
mailing or personal deliv-
ery to you of a notice un-
der section 9052 of the
California Probate Code.
Other California statues
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a credit-
or. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney know-
ledgeable in California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the
file kept by the court. If you
are a person interested in
the estate, you may file
with the court a Request
for Special Notice (form
DE-154) of the filing of an
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any pe-
t i t i on o r accoun t as
provided in Probate Code
section 1250. A Request
for Special Notice form is
available from the court
clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner:
TRENT C. MARCUS,
ESQ, TRENT C. MAR-
CUS, A LAW CORPORA-
TION
19900 BEACH BLVD, C-1,
HUNTINGTON BEACH,
CA 92648
BSC 225099
Westminster Journal
5 / 9 , 5 / 1 6 , 5 / 2 3 / 2 0 2 4 -
1 4 2 2 1 7

Legals-WHJ
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS

NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688981

A L T U R A  M E N T A L
HEALTH located at: 809
E M E R A L D B A Y , L A-
GUNA BEACH, CA 92651.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement, Regis-
t r a n t / s / : S O L A R A
HEALTH, INC, 809 EMER-
A L D B A Y , L A G U N A
BEACH, CA 92651. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by:
CORPORATION. Regis-
trant/s/: DERIK BRIAN,
CHIEF EXECUTIVE OF-
FICER . I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 2 9 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/2,9,16,23/24-142085

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246688676

NO.1  CHINESE  FOOD
EXPRESS  located at :
17451 BEACH BLVD,
HUNTINGTON BEACH,
CA 92647. County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
m e n t ,
Reg is t ran t /s / :SPRING
STAR RESTAURANT
INC, 17451 BEACH BLVD,
HUNTINGTON BEACH,
CA 92647. Have you star-
ted doing business yet?
NO. This business is con-
ducted by: CORPORA-
TION. Reg is t ran t /s / :
RUIZHU HUANG, CHIEF
EXECUTIVE OFFICER. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 4 / 2 4 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/9,16,23,30/24-142137

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246689269

S A N T A  A N A  F O O D
CHAMPION  located at:
1130 W. STANFORD
STREET, SANTA ANA,
CA 92707. County: Or-
ange. This is a New State-
ment, Registrant/s/: JE-
SUS MORAN GRANA-
DOS, 1130 W. STAN-
FORD STREET, SANTA
ANA, CA 92707. Have you
started doing business
yet? NO. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. Registrant/s/: JESUS
MORAN GRANADOS. I
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 5 / 0 1 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/9,16,23,30/24-142144

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 20246689260

LEI POP located at: 5815
E LA PALMA #128, ANA-
HEIM, CA 92807. County:
Orange. This is a New
Statement, Registrant/s/:
LEI MARKETING, 5815
LA PALMA #128, ANA-
HEIM, CA 92807. Have
you started doing busi-
ness yet? NO. This busi-
ness is conducted by:
CORPORATION. Regis-
t rant /s/ : PAUL PHAM,
CHIEF EXECUTIVE OF-
FICER. I declare that all
information in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
O r a n g e C o u n t y o n
0 5 / 0 1 / 2 0 2 4 .

Westminster Journal
5/9,16,23,30/24-142181


